
City of Rochester, NH Chemicals for Wastwater & Water Treatmetn Facilities Bid # 21-39

May 13, 2021 1:30 PM

Coyne Dubois Harcross Chemrite Carus Borden and Remington Kemeira Shannon

Roberts 

Chemical Univar ChemTrade Holland

Aluminum Sulfate 48% No Bid No Bib No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.36/gl No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.3635/gal 1.10/gal

Sodium Hydroxide-25% No Bid No Bib 1.2173/gal No Bid No Bid .8337/ gal No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.7938/gal No Bid No Bid

Non Zinc Ortopolysphospahte

1.2771 /lb

No Bib No Bid No Bid 1.23/lb No Bid No Bid 1.33/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 15% No Bid No Bib 1.0890/gal No Bid No Bid

.1141 /lb

 1.1410/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.185/lb No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hyrosulfite Conc.

90% 220 lb drum 2.4775/lb No Bib No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Fluoride No Bid No Bib 1.2900/lb 1.34/lb No Bid 1.1660/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dense Soda Ash No Bid

0.18475/lb 

(369.50/ton) 0.1996/lb No Bid No Bid .1963/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1957/lb No Bid No Bid

Sodium Bicarbnate-Bulk No Bid No Bib No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Bicarbonate-50 lb bag No Bid No Bib No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Powedered Acitivate Carbon

2.6765/lb min 

No Bib No Bid 1.25/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Potassium Permanganate 1.7629/lb No Bib 1.6500/lb 1.589/lb No Bid 2.1069/lb No Bid 1.74/lb No Bid 1.79/lb No Bid No Bid

Hydrogen Peroxide, 50% .4430/lb No Bib .4900/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid .45/lb No Bid No Bid No Bid
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