
City of Rochester

Equipment Rental and Contstruction Contracting Services Bid # 21-23

12/3/2020 2:30 PM

Description Rate/Hour

Mobilization 

Cost Rate/Hour

Emergency 

Mobilization Rate Rate/Hour

Mobilization 

Cost Rate/Hour

Emergency 

Mobilization 

Rate

Large Excavator-Track no bid no bid no bid nobid $180.00 $750.00 $180.00 $750.00

Medium Excavator-Track Cat 320B or Similar $150.00 $500.00 $170.00 $650.00 $145.00 $550.00 $145.00 $550.00

Excavator w/hoe-ram no bid no bid no bid nobid $280.00 $550.00 $280.00 $550.00

Excavator-Rubber Tires Cat M318 or similar no bid no bid no bid nobid $145.00 $290.00 $145.00 $290.00

Large Pay Loader Cat 966G or similar no bid no bid no bid nobid $165.00 $330.00 $165.00 $330.00

Medium Pay loader Cat 938G or similar $125.00 $250.00 $145.00 $350.00 $135.00 $270.00 $135.00 $270.00

Backhoe Case 580 or similar $110.00 $250.00 $130.00 $350.00 $115.00 $230.00 $115.00 $230.00

Tri-axle dump truck $85.00 no bid $95.00 nobid $87.00 $87.00 $87.00 $87.00

10-wheel dump truck $80.00 no bid $90.00 nobid $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00

6-wheel dump truck no bid no bid no bid nobid $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00

1-ton dump body truck no bid no bid no bid nobid $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00

Grader no bid no bid no bid nobid $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $165.00

Vibratory soil compactors $85.00 $350.00 $95.00 $450.00 $100.00 $375.00 $100.00 $375.00

Small bulldozer Cat D3 no bid no bid no bid nobid $115.00 $375.00 $115.00 $375.00

Medium bulldozer Cat D5 $145.00 $350.00 $165.00 $450.00 $135.00 $375.00 $135.00 $375.00

Road Reclaimer no bid no bid no bid nobid $295.00 $375.00 $295.00 $375.00

Trench Box $125.00 $350.00 $125.00 $350.00 $100.00 $375.00 $100.00 $375.00

General Labor $45.00 xx $54.00 xx $35.00 xx $35.00 xx

Utiltiy Pipe Layer $45.00 xx $54.00 xx $40.00 xx $40.00 xx

Crew Supervision/Layout $90.00 xx $105.00 xx $75.00 xx $75.00 xx

Labor Foreman $90.00 xx $105.00 xx $55.00 xx $55.00 xx

Utilty truck $75.00 xx $75.00 xx $20.00 xx $20.00 xx

Power broom $110.00 xx $130.00 xx $135.00 xx $135.00 xx

Water truck $100.00 xx $100.00 xx $95.00 xx $95.00 xx

Traffic control signage $30.00 no bid $30.00 nobid $50.00 $95.00 $50.00 $95.00

Variable message board no bid no bid no bid nobid $50.00 $95.00 $50.00 $95.00

Variable message board no bid no bid no bid nobid $200.00 $95.00 $200.00 $95.00

Mackinnon & Sons Excavating SUR
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