City of Rochester, NI Water & Sewer Inventory Bid # 20-23
September 5, 2019 3:00 PM

Item # Item Description: Ti-Sales Stiles
1 [20180-TPO 4" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
2 |20260-TPO 6" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
3 ]20350-TPO 8" TPO DUCTILE 52 CL per ft. no bid no bid
4 120450-TPO 10" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
5 ]20450-FST 10" FST DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
6 |20560-TPO 12" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
7 |20640-FST 14" FST DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
8 120720-TPO 16" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
9 |20800-FST 18" FST DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
10 |20880-TPO 20" TPO DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
11 [20960-FST 24" FST DUCTILE 52CL per ft. no bid no bid
12 146020 3/4" dia x 60' COIL K_COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
13 46030 3/4" dia x 100' COIL K-COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
14 146040 1" dia x 60' COIL K-COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
15 [46050 1" dia x 100' COIL K-COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
16 146070 1.5" dia x 60' COIL K-COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
17 (46080 2" dia x 40' COIL K-COPPER TUBING no bid no bid
18 146130-B 3/4" dia x 100' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $27.00
19 [46150-B 1" dia x 100' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $42.00
20 146162 1" dia x 500' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $210.00
21 (46164 1.25" dia x 100' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $75.00
22 146190-B 2" dia x 100' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $140.00
23 [46195-B 2" dia x 200' COIL BLUE CTS TUBING 200PSI no bid $280.00
24 123010 BXMIP PVC 2" PRESSURE FITTING no bid no bid
26 (27339 10" SDR 90 BEND 8XS no bid no bid
27 133126 3"dia. X 12"w MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
28 133190 4" MJ DI 45 deg. END CL no bid no bid
29 (33200 4" MJ DI 22.5 deg. BEND no bid no bid
30 (3330 4" DI END CAP no bid no bid
31 |33236 4" x 3" MJ DI REDUCER CL no bid no bid
32 133270 4" FOSTER MJ ADAPTOR no bid no bid
33 |33275 4" x 12" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
34 (33360 6" MJ DI TEE CL no bid no bid
35 |33375 6" x 6" MJ DI HYD TEE CL no bid no bid
36 (33410 6" MJ DI 45 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
37 133435 6" MJ DI 11.25 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
38 133525 6" FOSTER MJ ADAPTOR W/ACC PKG no bid no bid
39 33535 6" x 12" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
40 |33548-1 6"dia. X 12"offset X 30"L GRADELOK ANCHOR EXT. [no bid no bid
41 133585 6" dia. MJ DI SOLID CAP CL no bid no bid
42 (33595 6"dia. X 2" TAP DI CAP CL no bid no bid
43 |33615 8" MJ DI TEE CL no bid no bid




44 133625 8" x 6" x 8" DI TEE CL no bid no bid
45 (33660 8" MJ DI 90 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
46 133670 8" MJ DI 45 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
47 (33680 8" MJ DI 22.5 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
48 133690 8" MJ DI 11.25 deg. BEND CL no bid no bid
49 (33720 8" x 6" MJ DI REDUCER CL no bid no bid
50 |33729 8" x 6" MJ DI REDUCER LEB CL no bid no bid
51 |33800 8" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ACC no bid no bid
52 |33810 8" x 12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
53 133860 8" MJ DI SOLID CAP CL no bid no bid
54 133870 8" dia. X 2" TAP MJ DI CAP no bid no bid
55 133886 8" x 8" MJ DI CROSS CL no bid no bid
56 |34080-0 10" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ACC PKG no bid no bid
57 134095 10" x 12" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
58 |34145 10 MJ DI SOLDI CAP CL no bid no bid
59 [34230 12" x 6" MJ DI HYD TEE CL no bid no bid
60 |34245 12" 90 BEND no bid no bid
61 |34255 12"dia. 45 deg. DI BEND no bid no bid
62 |34330 12" x 8" MJ DI REDUCER CL no bid no bid
63 |34355 12" x 6" MJ DI REDUCER CL no bid no bid
64 |34400 12" x 18" MJ DI OFFSET CL no bid no bid
65 [34420 12" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ACC PKG no bid no bid
66 |34440 12" x 12" DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
67 34500 12" MJ DI SOLID CAP CL no bid no bid
68 |34715-1 16" MJ DI 22.5 deg. BEND no bid no bid
69 |34774-1 16" x 15" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
70 |34836 18"X15" MJ SOLID SLEEVE DI no bid no bid
71 |34877 18" x 15" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
72 |34977 20" x 15" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
73 |35087 24" x 15" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE no bid no bid
74 |37046-1 8" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG no bid $45.27
75 |37056-1 10" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG no bid $64.69
76 |37066-1 12" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG no bid $86.72
77 |37111-1 16" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG no bid $158.25
78 |37135-600 3" FLANGE THRD no bid no bid
79 |37147-1 3" x 1" FLG FILLER PIECE no bid no bid
80 |37216-4-600C 4" x 4" FLG FILLER PIECE no bid no bid
81 138082 3" FLANGE RING no bid no bid
82 [38013-1 5/8" x 2.5" FLG BOLT & NUT 304SS no bid no bid
83 [38014-1 5/8" x 3" FLG BOLT & NUT 304SS no bid no bid
84 138082 3" FLANGE RING no bid no bid
85 |38110 4" FLG RING GASKET RB no bid no bid
86 [39191-1 4" MJ DI RS TAP VLV OR RED NUT no bid no bid
87 |39194-1 4" MJ DI RS VALVE no bid no bid
88 [39317-1 6" MJ DI RS TAP VLV OR RED NUT no bid no bid
89 |39335-1 6" MJ DI RS VALVE OR RED NUT no bid no bid
90 [39471-1 8" MJ DI RS VALVE OR RED NUT no bid no bid




91 |39497-2 8" MJ DI RS TAP VLV OR RED NUT no bid no bid
92 |39569-04RM 8" x 4" SS TAP SLEEVE no bid no bid
93 [39687-1 10" MJ DI RS TAP VLV OR RED NUT no bid no bid
94 139741 10" MJ DI RS VALVE OR RED NUT no bid no bid
95 [39884-2 12" GATE MJ x MJ no bid no bid
96 |39889-1 12" MJ DI RS TAP VLV OR RED NUT no bid no bid
97 144092 4" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
98 144094 4" MJ DI GRIP RING ACC PACK no bid no bid
99 144154 6" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## (44159 6 MJ ACC PACK DI STD no bid no bid
## 144160 6" MJ DI GASKET no bid no bid
## [44164-1 6" MJ DI GRIP RING ACC PKG no bid no bid
## (44232 8" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## (44234 8" MJ DI GRIP RING ACC PKG no bid no bid
## 144300 10" MJ DI GLAND no bid no bid
## (44310 10" ROMA GRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## 144370 12" MJ DI GASKET no bid no bid
## (44375 12" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## (44443 16" SPLIT RING no bid no bid
## (44479 18" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## 144497 20" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK no bid no bid
## |44515 24" MJ DI GASKET no bid no bid
## 144535 5/8" SS THREADED ROD no bid no bid
## (44620 5/8" HEAVY HEX NUT no bid no bid
## (47054 FEMALE ADPATOR no bid no bid
## (44640 3/4" HEAVY WASHER no bid no bid
##136106-LF 1/2" BRASS PLUG no bid $3.52
## (36112 3/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $1.40
##136118 3/4" x 2" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $1.75
## (36121 3/4" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $2.33
##136122 3/4" x 3.5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $2.60
## (36124 3/4" x 4" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.05
## 136125 3/4" x 4.5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.28
## (36127 3/4" x 5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.60
## 136128 3/4" x 5" BRASS NIPPLE HEX no bid no bid
## (36130 3/4" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $4.40
##136149-LF 3/4" BRASS TEE no bid $8.88
## (36152 3/4" x 1/2" BRASS TEE no bid $11.65
## 136161 3/4" BRASS 90 deg. ELBOW no bid $7.10
## (36163 3/4" x 1/2" BRASS 90 deg. ELBOW no bid $10.54
## 136165 3/4" BRASS 45 deg. ELBOW no bid $9.25
## (36169 3/4" BRASS THRD CPLG no bid $6.25
##136175-LF 3/4" BRASS PLUG LEAD FREE no bid $4.45
## (36181 3/4" x 1/2" BRASS BUSHING no bid $5.45
## 136184 3/4" 1/2" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $7.40
## (36190 1" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $2.04
## 136194 1" x 2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $2.50




## (36196 1" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.33
##[36197-5 1" x 3.5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.84
## 136199 1" x 4" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $4.35
##[36200-5 1" x 4.5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $4.85
## 136202 1" x 5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $5.35
## (36205 1" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $6.40
## 136226 1" BRASS TEE no bid $15.95
## (36247 1" BRASS 90 deg. ELBOW no bid $11.52
##136261-LF 1" BRASS THRD CPLG LEAD FREE no bid $10.61
##(36267-LF 1" BRASS PLUG LEAD FREE no bid $7.08
##136273-LF 1" x 3/4" BRASS BUSHING LF no bid $6.49
## (36279 1" x 3/4" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $12.01
## 136288 1.25" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.05
## (36292 1.25" x 2" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.45
## 136293 1.25" x 2.5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.95
## (36297 1.25" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $4.65
## 136300 1.25" x 4" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $6.12
## (36306 1.25" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $8.95
## 136327 1.25" x 4" BRASS TEE no bid no bid
## (36362 1.25" BRASS THRD CPLG no bid $23.04
## 136368 1.25" BRASS PLUG no bid $9.94
## (36377 1.25" x 3/4" BRASS BUSHING no bid $11.07
## 136383 1.25" x 1" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $26.27
## (36395 1.5" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.95
## 136398 1.5" x 2" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $4.25
## (36401 1.5" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $5.85
## 136405 1.5" x 4" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $7.60
## (36407 1.5" x 5" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $9.46
## 136482 1.5" x 1.25" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.95
## (36485 1.5" x 1" BRASS BUSHING no bid $15.75
## 136488 1.5" x 3/4" BRASS BUSHING no bid $15.75
## (36497 1.5" x 1" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $30.49
## 136509 2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE no bid $6.00
## (36515 2" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $7.40
## 136518 2" x 4" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $9.80
## (36524 2" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $14.29
## 136528 2" x 8" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $19.06
## (36542 2" x 12" BRASS no bid $28.16
## 136545 3" BRASS TEE no bid $187.11
##36572-LF 2" BRASS 90 deg. ELBOW LEAD FREE no bid $37.19
## 136587 2" BRASS THRD CPLG no bid $38.09
## (36599 2" x 1.5" BRASS BUSHING no bid $19.40
## 136602 2" x 1.25" BRASS BUSHING no bid $19.40
## (36605 2" x 1" BRASS BUSHING no bid $19.40
## 136608 2" x 3/4" BRASS BUSHING no bid $19.40
## (36611 2" x 1.5" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $49.40
## 136617 2" x 1" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $53.35




##146310 2" x 1" BRASS RED CPLG no bid $53.35
## 146400 2" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS no bid $1.83
##(46500-LF 3/4" BRASS INSERT TZ MIP PTM-1 no bid $7.60
## 146600 1" BR INSX MIP ADAPT (MAD) LF no bid $12.45
##136205 1" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE no bid $6.40
##136124 3/4" x4 BRASS NIPPLE no bid $3.00
##36261-LF 1" BRASS THRD CPLG LF no bid $10.61
## 146800 1.5" BRASS INSERT 56 TX MIP no bid $20.09
##147025 2" BRASS INSERT x MIP no bid $21.27
##147054-LF 1/2" x 3/4" CPLG CPPJXMIP no bid $12.79
##147080 1/2" x 3/4" CPLG CPP JX FEIP LEAD FREE no bid $15.99
##147160-Q 1/2" CPLG CCPJ x MIP no bid $12.79
##147165-Q 3/4" CORP CC x QUICK no bid $28.72
##147188 3/4" BALL CORP CC x QUICK no bid $42.48
##147200 3/4" CORP IP x CPPJ no bid $28.72
##147230-QLF 3/4" CORP PLUG CC LF no bid $6.89
##147250-Q 3/4" BALL CURB QUICK LF no bid $58.14
##147280 3/4" BALL CURB QUICK x FEIP no bid $45.18
##147310 3/4" BALL CURB x IP no bid no bid
## [47409-Q 3/4" CURB x CPPJ no bid no bid
##147410-Q 3/4" QUICK GASKET no bid $2.39
##147430-LF 3/4" CPLG CPPJ x IPPJ no bid $17.74
##147450-QLF 3/4" CPLG CPPJ x IPPJ LF no bid S17.74
##147460 3/4" CPLG QUICK x FEIP LEAD FREE no bid $13.85
##147480-Q-LF 3/4" CPLG IPPJ x FIP no bid $15.77
##147500 3/4" CPLG QUICK x MIP LEAD FREE no bid $13.15
##147520 3/4" CPLG IPPJ x MIP no bid $15.89
##147540 3/4" 90 deg ELBOW CPPJ x L44-33 no bid $20.71
##147730 3/4" x 1" CPPJ x CPP)J no bid $18.62
H## 147785 3/4" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS no bid $1.25
##147819-Q 1" CORP CC x CPPJ no bid no bid
##147850 1" CORP IP x CPPJ no bid $43.42
#1#147880-Q 1" CORP PLUG CC no bid $9.83
##147910-QLF 1" BALL CURB QUICK no bid no bid
##147930 1" BALL CURB QUICK x FEIP LEAD FREE no bid no bid
##148060-Q 1" BALL CURB QUICK no bid no bid
##148130-Q 1" CPLG CPPJ no bid $18.34
##148150 1" CPLG QUICK x FEIP no bid $18.78
##148170 1" COUPLING IPPJ x FEIP no bid $22.80
##148190-LF 1" COUPLING CPPJ x MIP no bid $15.58
##148210-Q 1" CPLG IPPJ x MIP LEAD FREE no bid $24.25
##148260-Q 1" COUPLING QUICK x IPPJ no bid $23.80
##148330 1" x 3/4" TEE QUICK no bid $41.33
##148380-Q 1" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS no bid $1.32
##148400-LF 1.25" BALL CURB QUICK no bid $138.49
##148410 1.25" BALL CURB CPPJ x IP LF no bid $126.48
##148420-Q 1.25" BALL CURB IP no bid $14.42




## (48430 1.25" CPLG QUICK x FEIP no bid $126.48
## |48460-QLF 1.25" CPLG CPPJ x MIP no bid $29.80
## 148525 1.25" CPLG QUICK LF no bid $31.67
## (48600 1.25" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS no bid $1.63
## 148640 1.5" BALL CORP CC x CPPJ no bid $125.18
## [48660 1.5" BALL CURB CPPJ no bid $209.15
## 148670 1.5" BALL CURB CPPJ x IP no bid $170.76
## |48680-Q 1.5" BALL CURB IP no bid $143.79
## 148750 1.5" CPLG QUICK no bid $61.35
## (48780 1.5" CPLG CPPJ x FEIP no bid $54.62
## 148910 1.5" CPLG CPPJ x MIP no bid $42.69
## [48990-Q 1.5" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS no bid $1.83
##149010-Q 2" BALL CORP CC x QUICK no bid $207.05
## [49050-Q 2" BALL CORP IP x QUICK no bid $207.05
##149070-Q 2" BALL CURB QUICK no bid $294.04
## (49080 2" BALL CURB CPPJ x IP no bid $237.42
##149110-Q 2" BALL CURB FEIP no bid $210.30
## [49150-Q 2" CPLG Q X FEIP LF no bid $65.04
## 149310 2" CPLG QUICK x MIP no bid $62.22
## [54060-RM 3/4" x 3" LEAK CLAMP 105 no bid $12.28
##154070-F 3/4" x 6" LEAK CLAMP 105 no bid $25.97
## |54080-R 3/4" x 5" 2 BOLT STEEL CPLG 105 no bid $16.61
##154142-RM 3" x 5" BOLT CPLG 132 no bid no bid
## [54170-F 1.25" x 3" LEAK CLAMP no bid $13.40
##154180-RM 1.25" x 6" LEAK CLAMP no bid $26.64
## [54181-RM 1" x 1" 4x6 FULL WRAP REP CLAMP no bid no bid
##154190-RM 1.25" x 6" LEAK CLAMP 166 no bid $26.64
## [54234-RM 1.5" x 6" FULL WRAP REP CLAMP no bid $26.97
##[54271-RM 2" x 8" REP CLAMP 235263 no bid $38.44
## [54303-RM 2" x 6" MACRO CPLG 250290 no bid no bid
##154310-RM 2" x 12" SS1 REP CLAMP 235263 no bid $56.22
## [54320-RM 1.5" x 6" FULL WRAP REP CLAMP no bid $26.97
##[54321-RM 2" x 3" LEAK CLAMP FULL WRAP no bid $14.89
## [54330-RM 2" x 6" LEAK CLAMP 238 no bid $27.68
##154472-RM 2" x 5" BOLT CPLG 23B no bid $29.91
## [54970-RM 4" x 12" SS 1 REP CLAMP 474514 no bid $69.75
##155564-RM 4" x 5" DI CPLG no bid no bid
## [55575-RM 4" x 6" MACRO CLPG 440560 no bid no bid
## 155600 4" FLANGE ADAPTOR no bid no bid
## [55695-RM 6" x 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 660-700 no bid no bid
##155700-RM 6" x 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 684724 no bid $53.94
##[55730-R 6" x 12" S REP CLAMP 656696 no bid $76.65
## 155745 6" x 12" SSI REP CLAMP 6847.24 no bid $76.65
## [55780-RM 6" x 16" SS1 REP CLAMP 684724 no bid $92.72
##155937-RM 6" x 12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4" CC 684724 no bid $98.82
## [55946-RM 6" x 12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 1CC 684724 no bid $98.82
##156020-RM 6" x 8" SS1 TAP CLAMP 2 CC 684724 no bid $70.11




##156267-RM 6 202N SADDLE 2C 663760 no bid $29.21
##(56287-RM 6 202N SADDLE 2IP 663760 no bid $35.58
##156378-RM 6" x 6" MACRO CPLG 660760 no bid no bid
## [56384-RM 6" x 5" CPLG 686720 no bid no bid
##56570-RM 8" x 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 900940 no bid $59.73
## [56604-RM 8" x 12" REP CLAMP 900940 no bid $90.14
##|56640-RM 8" x 16" SS1 REP CLAMP 900940 no bid $106.25
## (56781 8" x 8" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4" CC no bid $78.40
#1#156783 8" x 12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4" CC no bid $112.31
##[56967-1RM 8 202N SADDLE 1/14CC 863980 no bid $39.91
##156988-RM 8" x 1.5" IP SS DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE no bid S77.64
## [57050-RM 8" x 2" IP SS DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE no bid $77.64
##|57133-RM 8" x 6" Macro CPLG 860975 no bid no bid
##(57139-RM 8" x 6" MACRO CPLG 860975 no bid no bid
## (57150 8" x 5" DUCT CPLG 899940 no bid no bid
##(57270-F 8" F BELL CLAMP 905930 no bid $95.28
##57325-RM 10" x 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 11041144 no bid $77.45
##(57361-RM 10" x 12" SS1 REP CLAMP 11041144 no bid $121.58
##|57400-RM 10" x 15" F SS REP CLAMP no bid $139.89
##(57476-RM 10" x 12" SS REP CLAMP 11401220 no bid no bid
##|57812-RM 10" F CLAMP 202 SADDLE 2" CC 10-00-11-10 no bid no bid
##(57813-RM 10 202N SADDLE 2" CC11.10-12.12 no bid no bid
##157849 10 STYLE 262 HYMAX CPLG 10701200 no bid no bid
## (57868 10" x 6" DI CPLG 10891140 no bid no bid
##|57897-RM 10" x 6" MACRO CPLG 10701190 no bid no bid
##157930 10" BELL CLAMP no bid $119.45
##|58005-RM 12" x 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 13151355 no bid no bid
## [|58068-RM 12" x 12" SS REP CLAMP 12701310 no bid no bid
##|58070-RM 12" x 12" SS REP CLAMP 13151355 no bid no bid
##(58111-RM 12" x 16" SS REP CLAMP 13151355 no bid no bid
##|58355-RM 12 202N SADDLE 3/4 CC no bid $84.33
## [58438-RM 12 202N SADDLE 1 CC no bid $46.96
##|58496-RM 12 202N SADDLE 1.5 CC 13201438 no bid $59.51
## [58556-RM 12V 202N SADDLE 2CC 13201438 no bid $59.51
##158600-F 12 x 6F DI CPLG 13201356 no bid no bid
## 158601 12 HYMAX CPLG no bid no bid
##|58642-RM 12 x 6 MACRO CPLG 112701380 no bid no bid
##158643-RM 12 x 6 MACRO CPLG 13151440 no bid no bid
## [58690-RM 12" BELL CLAMP no bid $129.57
##158760-RM 14 x 16 SS REP CLAMP no bid $257.07
## [59050-RM 16 BELL CLAMP 17401780 no bid no bid
##159210-RM 18 BELL CLAMP no bid no bid
##(59270-F 20 x 20 FSS REP CLAMP no bid no bid
##159350-RM 20 BELL CLAMP no bid no bid
##(59452-RM 24 x 10 DI CPLG 25302580 no bid no bid
##159460-RM 24 BELL CLAMP 25802632 no bid no bid
## (22516 HYDRANT MARKER 5' W/SPRING no bid no bid




##141885 6" W HYD TOP EXT no bid no bid
## 141890 12" W HYD TOP EXT no bid no bid
## 141895 18" W HYD TOP EXT no bid no bid
## 141905 W HYD BREAK REAPIR KIT DI no bid no bid
## 141972 W HYD CPLG STUD 2.88 no bid no bid
##141973 W HYD CPLG NUT 4.87 2.89 no bid no bid
## (41974 W HYD BREAK CPLG 2 HALVES IRON no bid no bid
##141979 W HYD MAIN VALVE RUBBER 35 no bid no bid
## (42715 B-62-B HYDRANT BRAK AWAY REPAIR KIT no bid no bid
## 142325 5.25x 6" GUARDIAN HYD EXT K81A no bid no bid
## 142326 5.25x 12" GUARDIAN HYD EXT K81A no bid no bid
##142327-1 5.25 K81A SAFETY REPAIR KIT no bid no bid
##142328-52 k-11 HYD SEAT RING 5.25 no bid no bid
##142377-1 5.25 EDDY BREAK REPAIR KIT WD no bid no bid
##142494-1 4 172M-CENT HYD EXT 12" no bid no bid
##142500-2 4.5" M-CENT BREAK REP KIT no bid no bid
##142632-4 2.5" x 2" MNSTX MIP ADAPTER no bid no bid
##142634-1 2.5" x 1" ADAPTOR no bid no bid
## 142643 #2 ECLIPSE YARD HYD 5-0 no bid no bid
## 142647 #77 MAIN GUARD BLOW-FF HYDRANT 5'6" no bid no bid
##142684-ND B84 HYD 5-0" OR 6MINST B41-3WAY no bid no bid
##142684-1ND B84 HYD 5'6" OR 6MINST B41-3WAY no bid no bid
##142684-2ND B84 HYD 6' OR 6MINST B41-3WAY no bid no bid
## 142714 5.25 B84B HYD REP KIT no bid no bid
## 142716 5.25 B62 HYD REPAIR KIT 21985 no bid no bid
B84 6 HYD SEAT L/DRN 35-02 w/DRAIN LEVER &
##142718-46LD SEAT O-RING no bid no bid
## 142720 5.25 x 6" B84 HYD EXT no bid no bid
##142720-1 5.25x 12" B84 HYD EXT TM no bid no bid
##142720-2 B-84-B 18" HYD EXT no bid no bid
##142725 5.25 B84 HYD MAINT KIT no bid no bid
##1427720-2 51/4 X 18 B84 HYD EXT TM 18LG no bid no bid
## 163431 BRASS HYDRANT ADAPTER 2.5" no bid no bid
## 163437 MALE x MALE HEX NIPPLE 2" NPT (M) x 2" NPSH (M) |no bid no bid
##149490-6 6" OMNI T2 CHAMBER COMPLETE no bid no bid
##149500-3 1.5" OMNI T2 METER no bid no bid
## 149510 2" OMNI T2 METER TRPL 100F no bid no bid
## 149520 3" OMNI T2 METER TRPL 1000F no bid no bid
## 149530 4" OMNI T2 METER no bid no bid
## 149535 1.5" OMNI C2 METER no bid no bid
## 149540 2" OMNI C2 METER no bid no bid
## 149547 OMNI H2 METER w/STRAINER NST no bid no bid
## 149550 4" OMNI C2 METER no bid no bid
## 150024 5/8" SRII OP ECR METER 100F w/PAD LF no bid no bid




##150037-LF 5/8" x 3/4" SRII ECR 100F w/PAD LF no bid no bid
## 150063 ECR TOUCH PAD no bid no bid
## 150069 REMOTE METER WIRE 3-22GA no bid no bid
## 150096 5/8" METER GASKET no bid $0.16

## 150133 3/4" SR ECR METER 100CF w/PAD no bid no bid
##150149-2-LF 1" SRII ECR/DM 100F LF no bid no bid
## 150196 3/4" METER GASKET RUBBER 10D no bid $0.20

## 150203 1" METER GASKET RUBBER 1.5" OD no bid $0.25

## 150285 1.5" BRONZE METER FLANGE FEIP no bid no bid
## 150296 2" BRONZE METER FLANGE SET RED HEAD no bid no bid
##150299-3 IPERL 3 TERMINAL SCREWS ONLY no bid no bid
##150300-83S 1" IPERL SMT METER F 3W DIR MOUNT no bid no bid
##150300-245 5/8" x 3/4" IPERL SMT METER F3W DIRECT no bid no bid
## 150305 1.5" METER GASKET FLANGE EACH no bid no bid
##150307-510M 510M NP SP TC w/LD&HR no bid no bid
## 150310 2" METER GASKET FLANGE EACH no bid no bid
## 150315 5/8" x 2.5" FLANGE NUT & BOLT no bid no bid
## 150320 3/4" x 2.75" FLANGE NUT & BOLT no bid no bid
##150323-LF MXU 510R NP SINGLE PORT TC w/ITR no bid no bid
## 150325 MXU 510R NP SINGLE PORT TC w/ITR no bid no bid
## 150395 3" HYDRANT METER SF W/C w/SCREEN NST no bid no bid
## 150400 3" HYDRANT METER SG no bid no bid
##151226-LF 1" LF909 QT RPZ no bid no bid
##151243-LF 3/4" #7 WATTS DUAL CHECK BFP IP LEADER no bid no bid
##151254-4 1.25" x 1" DUAL CHECK 41-4 114JF54 no bid no bid
##151255-LF 1" LFOO7M1 QT DOUBLE CHECK VALVE no bid no bid
##151260-LF #7 WATT DUAL CHECK BF PREV IP LF7 U2-2 no bid no bid
##151292-1LF 2" LF909M1 T RPZ no bid no bid
##151295-LF 2" LFO07M1 QT DBL CHECK VALVE no bid no bid
##151319-LF 3" DLFOO7 NRS DBL CHECK VALVE no bid no bid
## 152033 5/8" KORNERHORN BALL VALVE 1-3 no bid no bid
## 152035 3/4" #7 DUAL CHECK BF PREVENTOR 1-3K L/C no bid no bid
## 152046 5/8" METER #7 DUAL CHECK 3/4" CPPJ no bid no bid
## 152048 1" METER #7 DUAL CHECK 1 CPPILF no bid no bid
##152049-LF 1" METER DUAL CHECK BF PREVENTOR 3/4" FEIP LF [no bid no bid
## 152010 5/8" #1 KORNERHORN LEAD FREE no bid $44.00
##152050-LF 1/2" CP SETTER PAC JOINT 103K LF no bid $11.61
##152070-LF 3/4" CP SETTER PJ 103K LEAD FREE no bid $10.54
##152090-QLF 1" CP-Q SETTER PJ 1-3KLF no bid $13.25
##152270 5/8" METER CONNECT X 1/2" no bid $7.52

## 152370 5/8" x 3/4" METER ADPT RING no bid $4.35

##152380-LF 5/8" x 5/8" x 3/4" MTR ADPT RING L LEAF no bid no bid
##152570-LF 5/8" x 3/4" #2 KORNERHORN LF 741-2 no bid $46.45
## 152575 5/8" x 3/4" #52 BASEMENT RESETTER no bid $50.16
##152700-LF 3/4" METER CONN 3/4" MIP LF 74620 no bid $8.55

##152733-LF 3/4" 90 deg MTR CONN 3/4" MIP LF no bid $12.56
##152780-LF 3/4" #3 KORNERHORN LF no bid $51.51




## (52960 3/4" x 1" VALVE HANDLE STR no bid no bid
##52980-LF 1" #4 KORNERHORN LF 741-4 no bid $97.92
## 152985 1" #7 DUAL CHECK BF 4K L/C USE 1-3P)J no bid no bid
##[53020-Q-LF 1" CP-Q SETTER PJ 4-K LF no bid $20.13
##153220-LF 1" METER CONN 1" MIP LF no bid $13.15
##53235-LF 1" 90 deg MTR CONN 1" MIP LF no bid $17.93
##145420 5-6 SERVCIE BOX L/C no bid no bid
## 53594 11 STD METER BOX LID ONLY C3L no bid no bid
##153595-96 11 METER BOX COVER A3 no bid no bid
## 56527 WATTS LF7R10-U2 DUAL CHECK VALVE no bid no bid
#1#162045 12 x 17 x 12 RECT STD METER / VALVE BOX no bid no bid
##(45273-600 6 EZ RISE SLIDE RISER no bid no bid
##145285-05-600 5.25 x 1" VALVE BOX RISER FIXED STR no bid no bid
## (45005 VALVE BOX COVER no bid no bid
##145042-T 26/36 TF VALVE BOX w/COVER 664A no bid no bid
## (45070 26 VALVE BOX TOP TF no bid no bid
## 145080 36 VALVE BOX BELLED BASE no bid no bid
## 45125 26 VALVE BOX TOP TF no bid no bid
##145158 BOX SEAT VALVE BOX - ALIGNER QWP no bid no bid
## 45240 5.25 x 6" VALVE BOX FIXED RISER FLANGE no bid no bid
##145240-600 5.25x 12" BOX TOP ERD L/C no bid no bid
##45245-600 5.25x 12" BOX TOP EXTRD L/C no bid no bid
##145250-600 5.25 x 1" VALVE BOX RISER STR no bid no bid
## 45253 5.25x 24" BOX TOP EXTRD 1/C no bid no bid
##145271-600 EZ RISER COVER WATER no bid no bid
##145273-600 6" EZ RISE SLIDE RISER no bid no bid
##145274-600 12" EZ RISE SLIDE RISER no bid no bid
##145285-05-600 5.25 x 1" VALVE BOX FIXED RISER STR no bid no bid
##145286-1-600 5.25 x 2" VALVE BOX FIXED RISER STR no bid no bid
##145288-1-600 5.25 x 4" VALVE BOX FIXED RISER STR no bid no bid
##145370 1" SERVICE BOX PLUG COVER ROPE no bid no bid
##145372 1" SERVICE BOX PLUG REPAIR COVER no bid no bid
##145410 4-5 SERVICE BOX L/C no bid no bid
H## 145415 4.5-5.5 SERVICE BOX L/C no bid no bid
##145425 5.5-6.5 SERVICE BOX 24" no bid no bid
## (45430 6-7 SERVICE BOX L/C no bid no bid
##145476 1/2" x 24" SS SERVICE BOX ROD no bid no bid
H# (45484 1/2" x 30" SS SERVICE BOX ROD no bid no bid
## 45485 330" 9/16 SERVCIE BOX ROD no bid no bid
## (45490 9/16" x 36" SS SERVICE BOX ROD no bid no bid
##[45565-600 SERVICE BOX FOOT PIECE/HEAVY no bid no bid
## 45595 1" x 6" SERVICE BOX EXT w/SCREW L/C no bid no bid
## (45600 1" x 12" SS SERVICE BOX EXT w/SCREW LC no bid no bid
## 145605 1" x 18" SS SERVICE BOX EXT w/SCREW LC no bid no bid
##45610 1" x 24" SS SERVICE BOX EXT w/SCREW LC no bid no bid
##122010 2" dia. SDR 26 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid
##127010-1 4" dia. SDR 35 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid




##127020-2 6" dia. SDR 35 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid
##127030-1 8" dia. SDR 35 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid
##127040-2 10" dia. SDR 35 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid
##127050-1 12" dia. SDR 35 PVC Pipe per ft. no bid no bid
##123030 2" PVC 45 deg. Elbow per piece no bid no bid
##[25615 18" x 4" PVC Sewer WYE no bid no bid
##127060 4" PVC BxB WYE SWR no bid no bid
##(27062 4" PVC BxB TEE WYE SWR no bid no bid
#1#127065 4" PVC BxB 90 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
## (456 4" PVC BxS 90 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127075 4" PVC BxB 45 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
## (27080 4" PVC BxS 45 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
#1#127085 4" PVC BxB 22.5 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
## (27090 4" PVC BxS 22.5 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127100 4"x6" PVC BxS REDUCER SWR no bid no bid
##[27105 4" PVC END PLUG SWR no bid no bid
##127108 4" PLASTIC GRIPPER PLUG no bid no bid
##(27110 4" PVC END CAP SWR no bid no bid
##127113 4" CLEAN OUT ADAPTOR w/PLUG no bid no bid
##(27115-3 4" PVC BxB REPAIR CPLG SWR no bid no bid
##127135 6" PVC BxB WYE SWR no bid no bid
## (27140 6" X 4" PVC WYE no bid no bid
##127150 6" PVC BxB 90 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127160 6" PVC BxB 45 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127165 6" PVC BxS 45 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127170 6" PVC BxB 22.5 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127175 6" PVC BxS 22.5 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
H##127185 6" RT PVC END PLUG no bid no bid
#1#127188 6" PLASTIC GRIPPER PLUG no bid no bid
H##(27190 6" RT PVC END CAP no bid no bid
##127196 6" PVC BxB REPAIR CPLG SWR no bid no bid
H## (27206 8"Bx8"Bx6"B PVC TEE WYE SWR no bid no bid
##127230 8"Bx8"Bx6"B PVC WYE SWR no bid no bid
##127250 8" PVC BxB 90 deg. ELBOW SWR no bid no bid
##127279 8" PLASTIC GRIPPER PLUG no bid no bid
##127355 10" SDR PLUG PVC no bid no bid
##162195 4" QUIK CAP no bid no bid
H# (62218 4"x3" FLEX REDUCING CPLG CI/PVC no bid no bid
##62234 4" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC no bid no bid
H##162235 4" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CLAY no bid no bid
##62245 4" FLEX CPLG CI/PVC-CLAY no bid no bid
H# (62448 8"6" FLEX CPLG CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162247 4" FLEX CPLG CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162309 6" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162314 6" FLEX CPLG CI/PVC no bid no bid
H##162315 6"x4" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162317 6"x4" FLEX CPLG CLAY-PVC no bid no bid




##162318 4" CLAY X 6" PVC FERNCO no bid no bid
## 162326 6" FLEX CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC no bid no bid
## 162337 6"x4" CPLG PVC/PVC no bid no bid
## 162448 8"x6" FLEX CPLG CI/PVC no bid no bid
## 162453 8" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC no bid no bid
## 162455 8"x6" FLEX CPLG CLAY-AC/DI no bid no bid
## 162458 8" FLEX CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162475 10" FLEX CPLG PVC/PVC no bid no bid
## 162477 10" FLEX CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC no bid no bid
## 162488 10" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC no bid no bid
## 162524 12" FLEX CPLG PVC-PVC no bid no bid
## 162528 12" FLEX CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC no bid no bid
##162651-2 4" PVC x 10" PVC INSERTA TEE no bid no bid
##162653-2 4" PVC x 8" AC INSERTA TEE no bid no bid
## 162655 12" PVC INSERTA TEE no bid no bid
##162657-5 6" PVC x 12" AC INSERTA TEE no bid no bid
##162660-4 4" INSERTA TEE FATBOY 15"+ CC no bid no bid
##162891 6"-12"x4" TAP FLEX SWR TEE SADDLE no bid no bid
## 162892 6"-12"x4" TAP FLEX SWR WYE SADDLE no bid no bid
## 162893 8"-12"x6" TAP FLEX SWR TEE SADDLE no bid no bid
##162113-1 24" DIA. X 4" DEPTH PAMREX DI MH F&C - SEWER  |no bid no bid
##162113-32S 32" DIA X 4" DEPTH PAMREX DI MH F&C - SEWER  |no bid no bid
## 187025 PRESCOTT PLUG HYDRAULIC CEMENT per 5 gallon [no bid no bid
##162113-2 24" PARMEX DI MH F + C-DRAIN no bid no bid
##162113-32D 32" PAMREX DI MH F + c-Drain no bid no bid
##162114-CB3R 24" REXUS DI CB F + GRATE no bid no bid
##169360-1 Q-RAP COVER CUSHION 96" no bid no bid
##145392-600 SERVICE BOX PLUG COVER - SEWER no bid no bid
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