
City of Rochester, DPW Plow Blades & Parts Bid # 20-17

August 29, 2019 3:15 PM

ITEM

#
DESCRIPTION

Donavan 

Equipment Jack of All Blades Atlantic Broom Chemung Supply Jordan Equipment

1

Carbide insert blade 12" hwy. 

punch 6" x 3/4" with a 

minimum 3/8" wide x 5/8" tall 

carbide insert

no bid $51.75 $44.95 $38.00 $47.45

2
Volvo Grader-moldboard 

84”X8”X5/8”

no bid $140.00 $124.95 no bid $124.99

3
9’ Fisher plow blade 

108”X6”X5/8”

$103.43 $108.00 $86.40 $81.00 $84.16

4
8’ Fisher plow blade  

96”X6”X5/8”

$91.44 $96.00 $76.80 $72.50 $74.79

5
Fisher  Extreme 8 ½’ V plow 

blade

$205.00 $290.00 $235.00 $96.00 $185.76

6

Daewoo Loader cutting edge 

25 ¾”X16”1 ¼”  with bolts 

complet set of blades

no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,732.29

7
Plow cover blade 12”hwy 

punch 120”X6”X5/8”

$101.14 $120.00 $96.00 $90.60 $93.51

8
Plow cover blade 12”hwy 

punch 132”X6”X5/8”

$126.41 $132.00 $105.60 $99.60 $102.85

9
Grader plow cover blade 12" 

hwy punch 144"x8"x5/8"

no bid $180.00 $153.00 no bid $148.14

10

Trackless xx75 snow Quip 

snowblower cutting Edge 

51"x4"x5/8"

no bid $60.00 $58.00 no bid $54.82

11
Bombardier cutting edge 

60”X6”X5/8”

no bid $65.00 $64.00 no bid $46.96



12
Trackless plow blade  

60”X6”X5/8”

no bid $65.00 $64.00 no bid $54.04

no bid $900.00 no bid no bid $617.30

14 Cat 914K Loader no bid $600.00 no bid no bid $311.10

15

420 E Cat Backhoe 

¾”x8”x47” 5/8” bolt hole (2 

each)

$475.00 $250.00 no bid $248.90

16 Cat 226B3 Skid Steer no bid $375.00 $125.00 no bid $125.95

17
Volvo Snow bucket  ¾”8” 78” 

5/8” bolt hole

no bid no bid $325.00 no bid $185.00

18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts no bid $0.65 $0.54 $0.46 $0.54

19
½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade 

bolt

no bid no bid $0.90 $0.50 $0.66

20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt no bid $0.75 $0.90 $0.50 $0.80

21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt no bid $0.85 $1.07 $0.55 $0.89

22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt no bid $0.95 $1.17 $0.55 $1.00

23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt no bid $1.05 $1.28 $0.70 $1.13

24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt no bid $1.15 $1.40 $0.70 $1.20

25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade bolt
no bid $0.75 $0.68 $0.45 $0.68

26 Curb guard part # UG-478 no bid $80.00 $120.00 no bid no Bid

13

938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x 46 

½”  1” bolt hole middle 

Section (2 each), 1”x6”12 ½” 

1” bolt hole end piece (2 

each)
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