
City of Rochester, NH Sweeper Brooms & Parts Bid#20-16

August 29, 2019 2:30PM

Description Part # Old Dominion Lacal Atlantic Broom

United Rotary 

Brush

Jordan 

Equipment Donavan

4 Piece bolt on gutter broom wire with 

18 strand of wire in each hole
GBM435N

$120.16 $123.00 $120.00 $124.30 no bid $187.50

Suction liner inner wall TYM5019635 no bid $72.00 no bid $1,057.08 no bid $111.00

Liner RR Wall TYM5019636 no bid $50.00 no bid $25.00 no bid $105.00

Curtain set TYM502609 $400.00 $199.00 no bid $397.84 no bid $327.00

Skid Shoe TYM502570 $700.00 $395.00 no bid $830.78 no bid $687.00

Bah broom (center broom) TYM502566 $405.00 $425.00 $485.00 $249.41 no bid $552.00

Suction Wall Wear liner TYM5020658 no bid $195.00 no bid $476.24 no bid $308.00

21” Wafers flat 2 each $6.55 $11.50 $8.10 $4.02 $7.54 no bid

21 Wafers convoluted 40 each $6.95 $9.50 $8.10 $4.25 $6.60 no bid
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