City of Rochester, NH
July 11, 2019

Chemical Bid #20-02

Borden &
Univar Marubeni |Chemrite [Carus Kemira Brenntag [Harcros |Remington |Monson |Coyne Shannon |Chemtrade |Holland
Aluminum Sulfate 48% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.456 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.2825 $1.04
Sodium Hydroxide-25% $0.9608 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.0925 |[$1.0212 $1.261 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non Zinc Ortopolysphospahte No Bid No Bid No Bid S1.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.5863 |$1.13 No Bid No Bid
$S0.0844 [S.1106

Sodium Hypochlorite 15% $0.125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.9135 |$1.1060 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hyrosulfite Conc.

90% 220 Ib drum $2.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.769 $1.6639 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Fluoride $1.017 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.9200 |$1.0340 $0.998 |$0.8792 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dense Soda Ash $0.1898 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1958 |$0.1919 $0.1848 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S0.397

Sodium Bicarbnate-Bulk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.387 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate-50 Ib bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.3980 |[No Bid $0.414 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powedered Acitivate Carbon No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid $0.784 No Bid No Bid $0.908 |$2.0522 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Potassium Permanganate $1.837 $1.593 $1.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.5120 |$1.9347 No Bid $1.8694 |S1.614 No Bid No Bid
Hydrogen Peroxide, 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4750 |No Bid $0.548 |$0.4567 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
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