
Huntress Uniforms

 Neptune Uniforms & 

Equipment,  Inc. Galls LLC

 Body Armor 

Outlet 

333 Valley Street  360 Washington Street 1340 Russell Cave Road

 26 Ermer 

Road 

Manchester NH  03103  Haverhill MA  01832 Lexington KY  40505

 Salam NH  

03079 

603-626-1677  603-456-1234 800-876-4242  888-884-2427 

Article 1 No Bid 54.25$                                 48.00$                                    55.00$             

Article 1 No Bid 53.00$                                  $                                    48.00  $             55.00 

Article  2 No Bid 43.50$                                 43.00$                                    55.00$             

Article 2 No Bid 41.75$                                  $                                    43.00  $             55.00 

Article 3 - 6 pocket No Bid 54.95$                                 45.00$                                    No Bid

Article 3 - 8 pocket No Bid 59.25$                                 55.00$                                    No Bid

Article 4 Summer Hat No Bid 53.52$                                 70.00$                                    No Bid

Article 4 Winter Hat No Bid 54.75$                                 70.00$                                    No Bid

Article 5 No Bid 7.75$                                   9.00$                                      No Bid

Article 6 No Bid 8.00$                                   8.50$                                      No Bid

Article 7 8.50$                                 18.00$                                 8.00$                                      9.00$               

Article 8 6.25$                                 6.50$                                   4.00$                                      9.00$               

Article 9 6.00$                                 6.50$                                   4.00$                                      6.00$               

Article 10 No Bid 9.50$                                   4.50$                                      No Bid

Article 11 No Bid 50.95$                                 36.00$                                    25.00$             

Article 12 45.00$                               57.00$                                 55.00$                                    65.00$             

Article 13 48.00$                               49.00$                                 37.00$                                    42.25$             

Article 14 109.00$                             125.00$                               50.00$                                    108.50$           

Article 15 No Bid 295.00$                               No Bid No Bid

Article 15 No Bid 20.00$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 16 16.95$                               24.75$                                 17.50$                                    35.00$             

Article 17 No Bid 1.50$                                   1.50$                                      14.00$             

Article 18 No Bid 4.75$                                   No Bid No Bid

Bid 17-50 Results

Uniform & Equipment Bid



Article 19 No Bid 43.00$                                 38.75$                                    37.75$             

Article 20 No Bid 28.00$                                 49.50$                                    44.25$             

Article 21 59.00$                               63.46$                                 48.50$                                    51.25$             

Article 22 8.50$                                 13.85$                                 6.50$                                      51.25$             

Article 23 No Bid 71.00$                                 54.00$                                    51.25$             

Article 24 8.50$                                 13.85$                                 6.50$                                      51.25$             

Article 24 No Bid 13.85$                                 No Bid 51.25$             

Article 25 25.90$                               34.95$                                 No Bid 15.25$             

Article 25 26.90$                               34.95$                                 No Bid 15.25$             

Article 26 18.00$                               27.50$                                 No Bid 12.50$             

Article 27 19.00$                               36.50$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 28 No Bid 41.50$                                 No Bid 46.00$             

Article 29 No Bid 190.95$                               No Bid 162.50$           

Article 30 No Bid 35.25$                                 No Bid 50.50$             

Article 31 No Bid 37.95$                                 29.00$                                    55.00$             

Article 32 No Bid 29.75$                                 23.00$                                    10.75$             

Article 33 9.00$                                 12.75$                                 10.00$                                    7.00$               

Article 34 4.50$                                 9.00$                                   No Bid 7.00$               

Article 35 6.50$                                 9.25$                                   No Bid 5.75$               

Article 36 No Bid 37.50$                                 20.00$                                    No Bid

Article 37 9.60$                                 14.50$                                 11.00$                                    16.25$             

Article 38 No Bid 46.25$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 39 No Bid 46.95$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 40 No Bid 49.50$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 41 No Bid 50.50$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 42 No Bid 38.50$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 43 No Bid 42.50$                                 No Bid No Bid

Article 44 No Bid 13.95$                                 7.00$                                      No Bid

Article 45 No Bid 17.00$                                 17.00$                                    No Bid

Article 46 No Bid 5.95$                                   4.75$                                      8.50$               

Article 47 No Bid 5.95$                                   4.75$                                      8.50$               

Article 48 No Bid 5.95$                                   4.75$                                      8.50$               

Article 49 No Bid 15.95$                                 8.50$                                      16.75$             

Article 49 No Bid 15.95$                                 8.50$                                      12.75$             



Article 50 No Bid 14.50$                                 19.25$                                    17.00$             

Article 51 No Bid 2.75$                                   2.45$                                      No Bid

Article 52 No Bid 3.00$                                   No Bid No Bid

Article 53 No Bid 1.50$                                   1.00$                                      15.25$             

Article 54 No Bid 1.50$                                   1.00$                                      12.50$             

Article 55 No Bid 1.50$                                   1.45$                                      15.25$             

Article 56 No Bid 1.50$                                   1.45$                                      12.00$             

Article 57 No Bid 1.50$                                   15.00$                                    No Bid

Article 58 No Bid 5.45$                                   No Bid No Bid

Article 58 No Bid 5.35$                                   No Bid No Bid

Article 58 No Bid 5.35$                                   No Bid No Bid

Article 59 No Bid 125.00$                               105.00$                                  120.00$           

Article 60 No Bid 22.25$                                 20.00$                                    6.50$               

Article 61 No Bid 12.50$                                 10.00$                                    12.50$             

Article 62 No Bid 155.00$                               126.00$                                  No Bid

Article 63 No Bid 35.50$                                 28.00$                                    No Bid

Article 64 No Bid 40.35$                                 32.00$                                    32.00$             

Article 65 No Bid 18.25$                                 35.00$                                    48.00$             

Article 66 No Bid 23.50$                                 15.00$                                    No Bid

Article 67 No Bid 33.00$                                 25.00$                                    No Bid

Article 68 No Bid 1.75$                                   1.25$                                      No Bid

Article 69 No Bid 1.75$                                   1.25$                                      No Bid

Article 70 No Bid 1.50$                                   0.75$                                      No Bid

Article 71 No Bid 1.75$                                   0.75$                                      No Bid

Article 72 16.00$                               32.00$                                 22.00$                                    11.25$             

Article 73 No Bid 8.50$                                   8.50$                                      6.00$               

Article 74 10.00$                               11.75$                                 8.25$                                      26.00$             

Article 74 13.00$                               N/A N/A N/A

Article 75 No Bid 108.00$                               31.00$                                    No Bid

Article 76 No Bid 195.95$                               108.50$                                  89.50$             

Article 77 199.00$                             170.95$                               185.00$                                  205.00$           

Article 77 229.00$                             N/A N/A N/A

Article 78 85.00$                               107.50$                               76.00$                                    51.25$             

Article 78 99.00$                               N/A N/A N/A



Article 79 199.00$                             275.00$                               185.00$                                  205.00$           

Article 79 229.00$                             N/A N/A N/A

Article 80 No Bid 375.00$                               225.00$                                  No Bid

Article 81 115.00$                             169.00$                               120.00$                                  144.25$           

Article 81 129.00$                             N/A N/A N/A

Article 82 No Bid 160.00$                               100.00$                                  127.50$           

Article 83 No Bid 34.75$                                 28.00$                                    No Bid


