
City of Rochester, NH Automotive Filters Bid 3#17-20
October 13, 2016 2:45 PM

Oil Filters O'Reilly Auto Parts Napa
1036 $3.56 $2.95
1040 $3.56 $2.95
1042 $4.03 $3.33
1056 $6.52 $5.33
1060 $3.56 $2.95
1061 $4.02 $3.33
1064 $5.54 $4.54
1068 $3.47 $2.87
1085 $3.86 $3.20
1089 $9.93 $8.78
1194 $13.45 $11.89
1243 $4.42 $3.62
1259 $5.91 $5.23
1268 $4.31 $3.53
1311 $4.04 $3.68
1348 $3.56 $2.95
1361 $3.69 $3.36
1372 $3.86 $3.20
1394 $3.79 $3.44
1417 $12.91 $11.41
1455 $28.20 $24.91
1459 $6.61 $5.53
1494 $36.79 $32.50
1495 $29.92 $26.43
1515 $3.56 $2.95
1522 $4.09 $3.39
1551 $5.19 $4.25
1553 $5.13 $4.54
1602 $4.70 $3.86
1607 $5.69 $4.67
1637 $10.87 $9.61
1654 $27.40 $24.20
1663 $6.97 $6.16
1671 $13.13 $11.60
1730 $54.51 $48.16
1733 $46.96 $41.48
1734 $11.39 $9.23
1746 $9.35 $8.27
1748 $28.72 $23.51
1749 $15.81 $12.94
1759 $11.86 $9.71
1798 $8.32 $7.35



1799 $19.39 $15.86
1806 $7.69 $6.30
1860 $16.85 $14.89
7035 $5.66 $4.83
7045 $3.44 $3.13
7060 $3.64 $3.01
7076 $6.01 $5.32
7082 $4.24 $3.86
7084 $57.86 $51.11
7089 $10.55 $9.33
7098 $19.42 $17.16
7100 $16.43 $14.52
7116 $8.23 $7.27
7202 $6.71 $5.50
7243 $10.71 $8.77
7325 $10.27 $9.08
7325 $10.27 $9.08
7418 $58.08 $51.31
7430 $6.42 $5.68
7612 $44.36 $39.19
7669 $21.37 $18.88
7702 $11.57 $10.23
7707 $22.85 $20.19
7723 $28.76 $25.41
7861 $27.06 $23.91
77505 $10.77 $9.52
1791XE $20.26 $17.90
7740XE $55.73 $49.24
7744XD $32.39 $28.61
7746XD $32.17 $28.42
D82E10GV no bid $57.60
W01AG434 $49.06 $81.77
W01AG575 no bid $120.00
1361 $3.69 $3.36
1494 $36.79 $32.50
1495 $29.92 $26.43
7016 no bid no bid
7116 $8.23 $7.27
7701 $12.13 $10.72
7702 $11.57 $10.23
7723 $28.76 $25.41
58611 $13.25 $12.91
58707 $3.89 $5.60
58815 $11.45 $16.66
58836 $13.11 $13.75
58847 $11.20 $18.32
58881 $5.23 $9.15



58897 $9.14 $9.16
58955 $11.99 $10.84
15937 (Napa #) $8.01 $26.69
7740XE $55.73 $49.24
ATP15937 $8.01 $26.69
ATP17590 $13.01 $13.75
ATP17957 $3.89 $5.60
2013 $13.61 $12.38
2098 $4.57 $3.98
2222 $14.60 $12.90
2255 $21.29 $18.81
2291 $5.77 $5.10
2291 $5.77 $5.10
2321 $26.96 $23.82
2323 $7.63 $6.75
2359 $10.27 $9.08
2385 $5.43 $4.94
2420 $5.71 $5.05
2443 $12.84 $11.35
2487 $11.35 $10.32
2488 $11.79 $10.72
2491 $45.66 $40.34
2518 $20.71 $18.30
2679 $19.81 $17.50
2729 $12.59 $11.45
2769 $13.30 $11.76
2795 $22.52 $19.90
2809 $46.64 $41.21
2824 $34.28 $30.28
2868 $26.72 $23.61
2884 no bid no bid
2933 $15.77 $13.93
2966 $33.88 $29.93
2970 $5.11 $4.52
2985 $12.41 $10.97
2992 $1.58 $1.44
2997 $2.95 $2.69
4316 $15.87 $14.29
4805 $9.52 $8.66
4814 $9.21 $8.37
6035 $6.98 $6.36
6077 $5.80 $5.28
6117 $7.52 $6.84
6144 $7.52 $6.85
6174 $5.99 $5.45
6253 $8.14 $7.40
6280 $29.86 $26.38



6302 $6.44 $5.86
6307 $15.53 $13.72
6314 $25.60 $22.62
6379 $41.61 $36.76
6384 $12.19 $11.08
6417 $18.71 $16.53
6419 $10.49 $9.54
6433 $25.66 $22.67
6438 $15.29 $13.51
6440 $12.92 $11.76
6474 $30.77 $27.19
6475 $26.81 $23.69
6522 $16.78 $14.83
6560 $19.47 $17.20
6562 $25.67 $22.68
6569 $14.96 $13.22
6573 $11.46 $10.42
6627 $22.12 $19.55
6632 $20.68 $18.61
6671 $23.92 $21.14
6672 $16.05 $14.18
6678 $12.41 $10.97
6696 $54.87 $49.39
6722 $50.44 $44.56
6723 $33.50 $29.59
6749 $38.29 $33.83
6836 $41.84 $36.96
6837 $35.95 $31.76
6870 $44.63 $39.43
6871 $39.91 $35.26
6977 $2.05 $1.87
9088 $55.37 $48.91
9108 $46.79 $41.34
9109 $26.04 $23.01
9116 $8.83 $8.03
9135 $6.61 $13.39
9166 $16.71 $14.77
9184 $29.29 $25.87
9266 $29.48 $26.54
9314 $17.74 $15.68
9410 $21.56 $19.05
9429 $12.71 $11.56
9661 $15.81 $14.23
9665 $59.86 $52.88
9782 $47.06 $41.58
9783 $46.60 $41.16
9870 no bid $177.95



9883 $11.08 $10.07
9910 $15.18 $13.41
P623400 no bid $116.56
3031 $2.39 $2.18
3076 $15.75 $13.92
3091 $25.48 $22.51
3118 $6.28 $5.14
3166 $4.59 $3.76
3192 $10.25 $9.06
3195 $6.51 $5.76
3196 $10.34 $9.14
3216 $9.29 $8.21
3219 $7.40 $6.54
3232 $25.18 $22.25
3243 $8.05 $7.32
3270 $6.02 $5.32
3296 $5.99 $5.45
3351 $5.54 $4.90
3352 $5.17 $4.57
3357 $7.70 $6.30
3358 $6.11 $5.00
3360 $3.88 $3.43
3361 $7.73 $6.84
3369 $14.81 $13.09
3370 $9.16 $8.09
3377 $9.11 $8.05
3390 $5.81 $5.14
3403 $8.22 $6.73
3407 $13.01 $11.50
3442 $19.23 $16.99
3472 $9.14 $7.48
3481 $8.05 $7.32
3507 $6.08 $5.38
3531 $16.72 $14.77
3548 $17.17 $15.17
3572 $8.90 $8.09
3595 $6.43 $5.85
3606 $19.39 $17.13
3609 $14.12 $12.48
3626 $9.79 $8.01
3693 $19.41 $17.15
3719 $11.52 $10.18
3719 $11.50 $10.18
3759 $14.11 $12.47
3759 $14.11 $12.47
3787 $17.99 $17.13
3791 $9.82 $8.68



3804 $13.04 $11.52
3817 $21.14 $17.30
3830 $12.19 $10.77
3916 no bid no bid
3960 $24.29 $21.46
3964 $17.46 $15.43
3976 $15.18 $13.41
3978 $19.58 $17.30
3994 $43.19 $39.11
3994 $43.19 $39.11
600066 $54.00 $47.70
600149 $44.27 $39.11
600158 $19.21 $16.97
3651XE $13.10 $11.58
D82E10GV no bid $57.60
4056 $4.55 $4.03
4071 $8.45 $6.92
4073 $14.08 $11.52
4428 $7.54 $6.66


	Original

