City of Rochester, NH

2016 or 2017 Four Wheel Drive One Ton Trucks Bid # 17-04

7/28/2016

2:30 PM

Item 1 Description Diprizio Liberty Chevrolet |Ron Currier Hilltop Grappone Ford
2017 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton

Option 1 Truck-Regular Cab with service body and liftgate $48,311.00 |$49,082.00 $47,749.00 $48,460.00
City Veh. #42-2--6 Chevrolet 500

Trade-in Value Vin# ITBHK39D46E167076 Estimated mileage 177,050 $3,512.00 |$5,500.00 $9,349.00 $5,500.00
Total Less Trade in value $44,799.00 |$43,582.00 $38,400.00 $42,960.00
2016 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton

Option 2 Truck-Regular Cab with service body and liftgate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
City Veh. #42-2--6 Chevrolet 500

Trade-in Value Vin# ITBHK39D46E167076 Estimated mileage 177,050 N/A N/A N/A N/A
Total Less Trade in value

Iltem 2
2017 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton Truck-Double Cab with Service body

Option 1 and liftgate $50,791.00 |$51,535.00 $49,686.00 $50,689.00
City Veh. #21 2005 Chevrolet 3500 Vin#1GBHK39285E189708

Trade -in Value estimated mileage 103,876 $2,591.00 |$6,000.00 $8,300.00 $6,000.00
Total Cost less Trade in Value $48,200.00 |$45,535.00 $41,386.00 $44,689.00
2016 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton Truck-Double Cab with Service body

Option 2 and liftgate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
City Veh. #21 2005 Chevrolet 3500 Vin#1GBHK39285E189708

Trade -in Value Estimated mileage 103,876 N/A N/A N/A N/A
Total Cost less Trade in Value

Iltem 3
2017 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton Truck-Double Cab

Option 1 with service body and liftgate $50,791.00 |$51,535.00 $49,686.00 $50,689.00
City Veh. #53 2005 Chevrolet 2500 HD

Trade-in Value Vin# 1GBHK24UX5E195190 estimate mileage 106,800 $3,792.00 |$6,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
Total Cost less Trade in Value $46,999.00 |$45,035.00 $43,686.00 $44,689.00
2016 Four Wheel Drive 1 Ton Truck-Double Cab
with service body and liftgate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cty Veh. #53 2005 Chevrolet 2500 HD
Vin# 1GBHK24UX5E195190 estimate mileage 106,800 N/A N/A N/A N/A

Total Cost less Trade in Value

Correction to math on bid form
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