City of Rochester, NH
Chemical Bid # 16-39

June 9, 2016

2:45 PM

Shannon Chemical |Monson Holland |Chemtrade |Borden & Remington |Coyne Harcros Kemira Water |Carus Univar [Chemrite |BHS
Aluminum Sulfate-48% NO BID NO BID 0.77 $1.215 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.84 NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Sodium Hydroxide-25% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.7425 NO BID 0.7170 NO BID NO BID 0.7987 |[NO BID NO BID
Non Zinc
Orthopolysphosphate 1.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.0065 NO BID NO BID 1.1136 NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Sodium Hypochlorite-15% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.7155 NO BID 0.7139 NO BID NO BID 0.8949 [NO BID NO BID
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc.
90% 220 Lb drum (Equivalent to NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Sodium Fluoride NO BID 0.759 NO BID NO BID 0.7223 NO BID 0.6725 NO BID NO BID 1.0750 ]0.73 NO BID
Dense Soda Ash NO BID 0.171 NO BID NO BID 0.1779 NO BID 0.1826 NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID 0.2035
Sodium Bicarbonate-Bulk Form NO BID 0.377 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Sodium Bicarbonate-50 Ib bag form
Equivalent to Natrium Grade #6 NO BID 0.407 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.3525 NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID
Potassium Permanganate 1.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.6200 1.7252 $1.8900 NO BID NO BID 5.3365 |1.88 NO BID




	REsults

