
City of Rochester
Plow & Wng Blades & Parts  Bid # 16-16
2:45 PM October 15, 2015

Item # Description Atlantic Broom Jordan Equipment Winter Equipment Valk H.P. Fairfiled Donovan

1
Carbide insert blade 12" hwy punch 6" x 3/4" with 
a minimum 3/8" wide x 5/8" tall carbide insert $53.00 $52.23 $62.00 $42.29 $58.00 NO BID

2 Volvo grade-moldboard 84"x8"x5/8" $42.50 $115.12 NO BID $102.84 NO BID NO BID
3 9' Fisher Plow blade 108:x6"x5/8" $79.48 $75.72 NO BID $97.50 $90.00 $154.00
4 8' Fisher plow balde 96"x6"x5/8" $70.65 $83.80 NO BID $86.50 $85.00 $135.80
5 Fisher extreme 8 1/2" V plow $225.00 $247.00 NO BID $70.50 $203.00 $321.30
6 Daewoo Loader cutting edge 25 3/4"x16"1 1/4" $295.00 NO BID NO BID $295.50 NO BID NO BID
7 Plow cover blade 12" hwy punch 120"x6"x5/8" $87.95 $84.13 NO BID $108.20 $110.00 $157.50
8 Plow cover blade 12" hwy punch 132"x6"x5/8" $96.95 $92.56 NO BID $119.10 $121.00 $173.25
9 Grader plow cover blade 12" hwy punch 84"x8"x5/8" $94.50 $115.12 NO BID $99.50 NO BID NO BID
10 Trackless snow blower cutting edge 50"x6"x1/2" $45.00 NO BID NO BID $65.00 $40.00 NO BID
11 Bombardier cutting edge 60"x6"x5/8" $50.00 NO BID NO BID $78.50 $49.50 NO BID
12 Trackless plow blade 60"x6"5/8" $50.00 NO BID NO BID $78.50 $49.50 NO BID

13
938H Cat Loader-1"x12"x46 1/2" 1" bolt hole middle section
(2 each) 1"x6" 12 1/2" 1" bolt hole end piece (2 each) $382.50 $234.68 NO BID $735.20 NO BID NO BID

14 Cat 914K Loader $365.00 $409.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 1420 E Cat Backhoe 3/4"x8"x47" 5/8" bolt hole (2 each) $145.95 $112.50 NO BID $152.60 NO BID NO BID
16 Cat 22B3 Skid Steer No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 Volvo Snow bucket 3/4"8"78"5/8"  bolt hole $215.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 1/2"x2" Plow bolts $0.71 $0.46 NO BID $1.00 $0.75 NO BID
19 1/2"x2 1/2 Flat head blade   bolt $0.75 $0.65 NO BID $2.00 $0.80 NO BID
20 5/8"x 2/12" Plow bolt $0.85 $0.59 NO BID $1.15 $1.20 NO BID
21 5/8"x3" Plow bolt $0.95 $0.63 $0.73 $1.75 $1.25 NO BID
22 5/8"x 3/12" Plow bolt $1.05 $1.09 $0.85 $2.25 $1.58 NO BID
23 5/8"4" Plow bolt $1.20 $0.68 $0.96 $3.50 $1.66 NO BID
24 5/8"x41/2" plow bolt $1.35 $0.92 $1.11 $3.75 $1.70 NO BID
25 5/8"x2" Flat head blade bolt $1.05 $0.55 NO BID $2.00 $0.84 NO BID
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