
City of Rochester, NH Water & Sewer Inventory
Bid # 16-06 08/13/15

ITEM #
EJP 
PART # EXT. DESCRIPTION STILES EJ PRESCOTT HD SUPPLY TI SALES

1 20180 TPO 4" TPO DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $18.89 $15.43 NO BID
2 20260 TPO 6" TPO DUCTILE 52CL # FEET NO BID $16.45 $13.43 NO BID
3 20350 TPO 8" TPO DUCTILE 52CL # FEET NO BID $22.95 $18.73 NO BID
4 20450 TPO 10" TPO DUCTILE 52CL # FEET NO BID $30.29 $24.74 NO BID
5 20560 TPO 12" TPO DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $37.85 $30.93 NO BID
6 20640 TPO 14" TPO DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $45.79 $37.98 NO BID
7 20720 TPO 16" TPO DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $54.65 $44.67 NO BID
8 20880 TPO 10" FST DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $30.29 $24.74 NO BID
9 20960 FST 24" FST DUCTILE 52CL #FEET NO BID $95.50 $73.56 NO BID
10 21350 5.25 K81 MAIN VALVE NO BID $85.00 NO BID NO BID
11 27060 4" RT PVC BXB WYE SWR NO BID $10.56 $9.50 NO BID
12 33270 4" FOSTER MJ ADAPTOR NO BID $78.00 $87.44 NO BID
13 33275 4"X12" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE NO BID $70.00 $57.26 NO BID
14 33360 6" MJ DI TEE CL NO BID $173.00 $141.47 NO BID
15 33375 6"X6" MJ DI HYD TEE CL NO BID $210.00 $163.03 NO BID
16 33400 6" JM DI 90 BEND CL NO BID $119.00 $97.68 NO BID
17 33410 6" MJ DI 45 BEND NO BID $97.00 $80.84 NO BID
18 33425 6" MJ DI 22.5 BEND NO BID $90.06 $73.43 NO BID
19 33465 4"X6" MJ REDUCER NO BID $69.00 $56.59 NO BID
20 33525 6" FOSTER MJAD W/ACC PKG NO BID $99.00 $118.69 NO BID
21 33535 6"12" MJ DI SOLDI SLEEVE NO BID $111.00 $85.56 NO BID
22 33575 6" MJ PLUGS NO BID $98.00 $58.61 NO BID
23 33585 6" MJ DI SOLID CAP NO BID $47.00 $39.07 NO BID
24 33595 6"X2" MJ DI TAP CAP NO BID $82.00 $62.65 NO BID
25 33615 8" MJ DI TEE CL NO BID $258.00 $177.18 NO BID
26 33635 8"X6" MJ DI HYD TEE CL NO  BID $246.00 $203.45 NO BID
27 33660 8" MJ DI 90 BEND CL NO BID $176.00 $143.49 NO BID
28 33670 8" MJ DI 45 BEND CL NO BID $142.00 $114.53 NO BID
29 33680 8" MJ DI 22.5 BEND CL NO BID $135.00 $111.83 NO BID
30 33690 8" MJ DI 11.25 BEND CL NO BID $126.00 $102.40 NO BID
31 33720 8"X6" MJ REDUCER CL NO BID $114.00 $94.32 NO BID
32 33800 8" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ ACC NO BID $155.00 $162.44 NO BID
33 33810 8"X12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE NO BID $135.00 $111.83 NO BID
34 33840 8" MJ DI SOLDI PLUG NO BID $98.00 $61.31 NO BID



35 33870 8:X2" MJ DI TAP CAP NO BID $110.00 $84.88 NO BID
36 33886 8" MJ DI CROSS CL NO BID $368.00 $312.59 NO BID
37 34030 10"X6" MJ DI REDUCER CL NO BID $110.00 $102.40 NO BID
38 34080 10" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ACC PKG NO BID $227.00 $212.44 NO BID
39 34095 10"X12" MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE NO BID $202.00 $167.75 NO BID
40 34190 12"  MJ DI TEE CL NO BID $461.00 $464.84 NO BID
41 34230 12"6" MJ DI HYD TEE CL NO BID $448.00 $371.20 NO BID
42 34255 12" DUCTILE BEND 45 NO BID $346.00 $286.99 NO BID
43 34265 12" MJ DI 22 BEND NO BID $294.00 $2,473.20 NO BID
44 34305 12"X10" MJ DI REDUCER CL NO BID $213.00 $175.83 NO BID
45 34330 12"X8" MJDI REDUCER CL NO BID $238.00 $183.92 NO BID
46 34355 12"6" MJ DI REDUCER CL NO BID $217.00 $179.87 NO BID
47 34400 12"18" MJ DI OFFSET CL NO BID $1,482.00 $1,339.28 NO BID
48 34420 12" FOSTER MJ ADPT W/ACC PKG NO BID $227.00 $218.69 NO BID
49 34440 12"X12" DI SOLID SLEEVE NO BID $273.00 $226.36 NO BID
50 34500 12 " MJ DI SOLDI CAP CL NO BID $148.00 $114.53 NO BID
51 36106 1/2" BRASS PLUG LEAD FREE $4.43 $3.00 $4.80 NO BID
52 36112 3/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $1.49 $3.00 $2.20 $2.29
53 36118 3/4"X2" BRASS NIPPLE $1.87 $3.00 $2.77 $2.89
54 36121 3/4"X3" BRASS NIPPLE $2.51 $5.25 $3.71 $3.86
55 36122 3/4"X3.5" BRASS NIPPLE $2.81 $3.60 $4.16 NO BID
56 36125 3/4"X1/2" BRASS NIPPLE No Bid $2.85 $2.20 NO BID
57 36127 3/4"X5" BRASS NIPPLE $3.92 $4.95 $5.81 NO BID
58 36130 3/4"X6" BRASS NIPPLE $4.77 $6.10 $7.07 $7.33
59 36149 3/4" BRASS TEE $8.84 $5.25 $5.98 $9.75
60 36152 3/4"X1/2" BRASS TEE $11.59 $5.85 $7.16 NO BID
61 36161 3/4" BRASS 90 ELBOW $7.08 $4.30 $9.66 $7.82
62 36163 3/4"X1/2" BRASS 90 ELBOW $10.54 $4.80 $5.31 NO BID
63 36165 3/4" BRASS 45 ELBOW $15.77 $4.30 $4.87 NO BID
64 36169 3/4" BRASS THRD CPLG LEAD FREE $6.22 $3.45 $8.47 $6.87
65 36175 3/4" BRASS PLUG $4.43 $3.00 $11.36 $4.90
66 36181 3/4"X1/2" BRASS BUSH LEAD FREE $5.43 $3.00 $7.39 NO BID
67 36184 3/4"X1/2" BRASS RED CPLG $7.39 $4.15 $3.93 NO BID
68 36190 1" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $2.19 $2.80 $3.25 $3.37
69 36194 1"X2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $2.71 $3.45 $4.00 $4.16
70 36196 1"X3" BRASS NIPPLE $3.64 $4.65 $5.37 $5.59
71 36197 5 1"X3.5" BRASS NIPPLE $4.21 $4.65 $6.24 NO BID
72 36199 1"X4" BRASS NIPPLE $4.73 $4.80 $7.01 $7.28
73 36200 5 1"4.5" BRASS NIPPLE $5.28 $5.35 $7.81 NO BID



74 36202 1"X5" BRASS NIPPLE $5.84 $7.45 $8.64 NO BID
75 36205 1"X6" BRASS NIPPLE $6.97 $8.85 $10.32 $9.45
76 36226 1" BRASS TEE $15.59 $9.30 $21.74 $17.54
77 36247 1" BRASS 90 ELBOW $11.52 $6.60 $21.44 $12.72
78 36267 1" BRASS PLUG $7.08 $3.30 $9.60 $5.91
79 36273 1"X3/4" BALL CURB CPPJXIP T LF $47.65 $105.00 NO BID $68.68
80 36279 1"X3/4" BRASS RED CPLG $12.01 $6.85 $11.46 $7.43
81 36288 1/1/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $3.31 $4.20 $4.90 NO BID
82 36292 1 1/4"X2" BRASS NIPPLE $3.78 $4.85 $5.59 NO BID
83 36306 1 1/4"X6" BRASS NIPPLE $9.72 $12.45 $14.38 NO BID
84 36327 1 1/4"X4" BRASS TEE $27.64 $13.10 $9.86 NO BID
85 36362 1 1/4" BRASS THRD CPLG $17.71 $8.15 $7.99 NO BID
86 36368 1 1/4" BRASS PLUG $9.94 $4.85 $5.57 $10.97
87 36374 1 1/4"X1" BRASS BUSH $11.07 $5.95 $6.70 $12.22
88 36377 1 1/4"X3/4" BRASS  BUSH $11.07 $5.95 $6.70 $12.22
89 36383 1 1/4"X1" BRASS RED CPLG $26.27 $11.10 $12.69 $28.99
90 36395 1.5 X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $4.30 $5.50 $6.32 NO BID
91 36398 1 1.2"X" BRASS NIPPLE $4.63 $5.90 $6.85 NO BID
92 36401 1 1/2"X3" BRASS NIPPLE $6.37 $8.10 $9.44 NO BID
93 36405 1.5"X4" BRASS NIPPLE $8.30 $10.60 $12.29 $11.74
94 36407 1.5"X5" BRASS NIPPLE $10.32 $13.55 $15.28 NO BID
95 36456 1.5" BRASS ELBOW $18.60 $13.10 $21.40 $25.43
96 36482 1.5"X1.25" BRASS BUSH $15.72 $7.55 $28.56 $17.35
97 36485 1.5"X1" BRASS BUSH $15.72 $7.55 $21.44 $17.35
98 36488 1.5"X3/4" BRASS BUSH $15.72 $9.25 $21.44 $17.35
99 36489 1.5"X1/2" BRASS BUSH $15.72 $14.00 $10.47 NO BID
100 36497 1.5"X1" BRASS RED CPLG $30.49 $14.00 $16.05 NO BID
101 36509 2"X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE $6.53 $8.35 $9.70 $10.07
102 36515 2"X3" BRASS NIPPLE $8.17 $10.35 $12.09 $12.54
103 36518 2"X4" BRASS NIPPLE $10.68 $13.55 $15.82 $16.41
104 36524 2"X6" BRASS NIPPLE $15.77 $20.00 $23.35 $21.37
105 36528 2"X8" BRASS NIPPLE $21.04 $26.70 $31.14 NO BID
106 36542 2"X12"  BRASS NIPPLE $31.08 $39.45 $46.00 $42.11
107 36581 2" BRASS 45 ELBOW $50.99 $23.56 $69.50 $56.25
108 36587 2" BRASS THRED CPLG $37.19 $18.25 $44.71 $42.03
109 36593 2" BRASS PLUG $20.36 $9.85 $27.55 $22.46
110 36599 2"X1" 1/2"  BRASS BUSHING LEAD FRE $19.40 $11.20 $26.44 $21.41
111 36602 2"X1.25" BRASS BUSH $19.40 $11.20 $26.44 $21.41
112 36605 2"X1 BRASS BUSH $19.40 $13.50 $26.44 $21.41



113 36608 2"X24" BRASS BUSH NO BID $13.50 NO BID NO BID
114 36611 2"X1.5" BRASS RED CPLG $19.40 $20.85 $23.82 $54.50
115 36617 2"X1" BRASS RED CPLG $53.35 $23.45 $26.84 $58.86
116 37042 1 6" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLND PKG $30.86 $38.29 $37.31 $25.33
117 37046 1 8"1400 WEDE RETAINER GLD PKG $41.88 $52.00 $50.93 $38.66
118 37056 1 10" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG $59.84 $74.00 $72.70 $57.22
119 37066 1 12" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG $80.22 $99.00 $96.21 $83.23
120 37091 1 20" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG $224.93 $312.00 $276.10 $266.64
121 37111 1 16" 1400 WEDGE RETAINER GLD PKG $137.07 $182.00 $171.77 $151.79
122 37220 600D 4"X2"  DI TAP FLG NO BID $68.06 $74.27 NO BID
123 38112 4" FLG ACCESS PKG RING W/B&N NO BID $8.75 $7.12 NO BID
124 38163 6 FULL FACE FLG ACC PKG NO BID $14.50 $10.82 NO BID
125 39194 1 MJ DI RS VALVE NO BID $499.00 $353.66 $500.77
126 39335 1 6" MJ DI RS VALVE OR NO BID $638.00 $451.09 $639.32
127 39471 1 8" MJ DI RS VALVE OR RED NUT NO BID $1,015.00 $718.44 $1,017.35
128 39741 10" MJ DI RS VALVE OR RED NUT NO BID $1,335.00 $1,120.19 $1,586.10
129 39884 2 12" GATE MJXMJ NO BID $1,815.00 $1,417.44 $2,006.89
130 41890 12" W HYD TOP EXT NO BID $360.00 NO BID NO BID
131 41895 18" W HYD TOP EXT NO BID $417.00 NO BID NO BID
132 41905 W HYD BREAK REPAIR KIT NO BID $141.00 NO BID NO BID
133 41972 W HYD CPLG STUD 2.88 NO BID $11.20 NO BID NO BID
134 41973 W HYD CPLG NUT 4.87 2.89 NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID
135 41974 W HYD BREAK CPLG 2 HALVES IRON NO BID $47.00 NO BID NO BID
136 41976 W HYD VALVE SEAT BRASS 31 NO BID $313.00 NO BID NO BID
137 41979 W HYD MAIN VALVE RUBBER 35 NO BID $61.00 NO BID NO BID
138 42325 5.25X6" GUARDIAN HYD EXT K81A NO BID $289.00 NO BID NO BID
139 42326 5.25"X12" GUARDIAN HYD EXT K81A NO BID $330.00 NO BID NO BID
140 42327 1 5 1/4"  K81A SAFETY REPAIR KIT NO BID $465.00 NO BID NO BID
141 42328 52 K-LL HYD SEAT RING 5.25 NO BID $300.00 NO BID NO BID
142 42377 1 5.24 EDDY BRAK REPAIR KIT WD NO BID $183.00 NO BID NO BID
143 42634 2 1/2" X 3/4" ADAPTOR NO BID $30.00 NO BID NO BID
144 42684 1 ND 5 B84 HYD-5-6 OR 6MJNSTB41-3WAY NO BID $2,216.00 NO BID NO BID
145 42684 ND 8 B84 HYD 5-0 OR 6MJNSTB41-3WAY NO BID $2,216.00 NO BID NO BID
146 42684 2ND 5 B94 HYD 6" OR 6" MJ NST B4103WAYNO BID $2,269.00 NO BID NO BID
147 42714 5 1/4"  B84B HYD REP KIT NO BID $197.00 NO BID NO BID

148 42718 46LD
B84 6 HYD SEAT L/DRN 35-2 W/DRAIN 
LEVER & SET O RING NO BID $375.00 NO BID NO BID

149 42718 16 HOSE NOZZLE O-RING 84-20-5 NO BID $8.90 NO BID NO BID



150 42718 50 5.25 B84 HYD VALVE NO BID $97.00 NO BID NO BID
151 42725 5.25 B84 HYD MAINT. KIT NO BID $428.00 NO BID NO BID
152 44092 4" ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PK NO BID $29.00 $31.88 NO BID
153 44154 6" ROMA GRIP ACC PAK NO BID $36.00 $37.31 NO BID
154 44159 6 MJ ACC PAK DI STD NO BID $21.00 $23.37 NO BID
155 44160 6" MJ DI  GASKET NO BID $5.25 $3.62 NO BID
156 44164 1 6" MJ DI GRIP RING ACC PKG NO BID $69.00 $15.92 NO BID
157 44232 8" ROMAGRIP ACC PACK NO BID $49.00 $50.93 NO BID
158 44300 10" MJ DI GLAND NO BID $15.00 $20.14 NO BID
159 44310 10" ROMA GRIP ACC PACK NO BID $74.00 $72.70 NO BID
160 44370 12" MJ DI GASKET NO BID $7.00 $7.30 NO BID
161 44374 12" MJ DI GRIP RING ACC PKG NO BID $110.00 $96.21 NO BID
162 44375 12"  ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK NO BID $99.00 $96.21 NO BID
163 44443 16" SPLIT RING NO BID $158.00 NO BID NO BID
164 44497 20 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK NO BID $299.00 $276.10 NO BID
165 45005 VALVE BOX COVER NO BID $15.00 $12.70 NO BID
166 45011 LEAD FLANGE ADAPTER NO BID $62.00 NO BID NO BID
167 45042 26/36 TF VAVLE BOX W/CVR 664A NO BID $130.00 $109.99 NO BID
168 45051 3/4" LEAD FLANGE ADAPTOR NO BID $62.00 NO BID NO BID
169 45070 26" VALVE BOX TOP TF NO BID $58.00 $47.76 NO BID
170 45070 27" VLAVE BOX TOP TF NO BID $58.00 $47.76 NO BID
171 45125 36" VALVE BOX BASE BELL NO BID $54.00 $44.53 NO BID
172 45158 BOX-SEAT VALVE BOX-ALGNER QWP NO BID $7.50 NO BID NO BID
173 45240 600 5.25"X12" BOX TOP E RD L/C NO BID $34.06 $35.80 NO BID
174 45245 600 5 1/4" X 12"  BOX TOP EXT RD END NO BID $45.00 $35.80 NO BID
175 45250 600 5.25" X 18" BOX TOP EXT RD L/C NO BID $51.00 $40.08 NO BID
176 45277 3/4" EZ RING NO BID $9.50 NO BID NO BID
177 45285 15-600 5.25"X1.25" VB RISER L/C STR NO BID $11.50 NO BID NO BID
178 45285 05-600 5.25" X 1" VB RISER NO BID $9.75 $20.04 NO BID
179 45286 1-600 5.25" VB RISER L/C STR NO BID $12.75 NO BID NO BID
180 45370 1" SERVICE BOX PLUG COVER ROPE NO BID $6.50 NO BID NO BID
181 45372 1"  SERVICE BOX PLUG REPAIR COVE NO BID $8.06 $9.37 NO BID
182 45410 4-5 SERVICE BOX L/C NO BID $17.60 $27.30 NO BID
183 45415 4" 1/2-5 1/2" SERVICE BOX L/C NO BID $17.95 $27.30 NO BID
184 45420 5-6 SERVICE BOX L/C NO BID $21.95 $28.24 NO BID
185 45425 5 1/2"X6 1/2" SERVICE BOX NO BID $25.00 $29.18 NO BID
186 45430 6-7 SERVICE BOX L/C NO BID $28.00 $30.09 NO BID
187 45476 1/2"X24" SERVICE BOX ROD SS NO BID $13.00 $13.33 NO BID
188 45484 1/2" X 40" SERVICE BOX ROD SS NO BID $18.00 $17.44 NO BID



189 45486 1/2" X 36: SERVICE BOX ROD STAINLE NO BID $24.00 $15.07 NO BID
190 45565 600 SERVICE BOX FOOT PIECE/HEAVY NO BID $16.00 $16.08 NO BID
191 45595 1"X6" SERVICE BOX EXT W/SCREW L/CNO BID $7.95 $17.34 NO BID
192 45600 1"X12"  SERVICE BOX EXT W/SCREW LNO BID $10.95 $18.78 NO BID
193 45605 1" X 18" SERVICE BOX EX W/SCREW L NO BID $12.95 $19.80 NO BID
194 45610 1"X24 SERVICE BOX EX W/SCREW L/CNO BID $14.00 $20.48 NO BID
195 46020 3/4"X60 K COPPER TUBE $5.20 $3.89 $4.84 NO BID
196 46030 3/4"X100 K COPPER TUBE $5.20 $3.89 $4.89 NO BID
197 46040 1"X60 K COPPER TUBE $6.81 $5.10 $6.31 NO BID
198 46050 1" 100 FT COPPER TUBE # FEET $6.81 $5.10 $6.31 NO BID
199 46070 11/2" X 60" COPPER TUBE $11.71 $8.65 $10.00 NO BID
200 46080 2" X 50' K COPPER TUBE # FEET SEPT $20.48 $14.50 $16.99 NO BID
201 46400 3/4" BRASS NISERT TZ MIP PTM-1 $6.33 $3.50 $9.07 $8.36
202 46500 1" BRASS INSERT X MIP $10.38 $5.00 $14.87 $13.70
203 46600 1.25" BR INSERT TX MIP $17.23 $4.95 $24.00 $22.75
204 46700 1.50" BR INSE56 TX MIP $16.74 $6.80 $24.00 $22.11
205 46800 2" BR INSERT X MIP $17.71 $12.85 $25.40 $23.40
206 47025 1/2" X 3/4" CPLG CPPJXMIP $10.66 $8.85 $13.54 $13.65
207 47080 1/2" CPLG CCPJXMIP $10.65 $10.50 $13.52 $14.39
208 47160 Q 3/4" CORP CC X QUICK $23.92 $34.00 $42.24 $32.29
209 47165 Q 3/4" BALL CORP CC X QUICK $35.39 $49.00 $42.24 $47.75
210 47190 3/4" CORP IP X CPPJ $23.92 $34.00 $33.68 $47.75
211 47230 Q 3/4" BALL CURB QUICK $48.44 $69.00 $59.84 $65.37
212 47250 Q 3/4"  BALL CURB QUICKXFEIP LF $37.64 $61.00 $52.53 $57.39
213 47250 3/4" BALL CURB CPPJXIP $42.53 $62.00 $71.35 $57.39
214 47280 3/4" BALL CURB X IP $37.64 $55.00 $81.07 $50.79
215 47310 3/4" CURB X CPPJ $48.44 $69.00 $59.84 $65.37
216 47370 SERVICE BOX TOP NO BID $69.00 $9.37 $29.74
217 47410 Q 3/4" CPLG CPPJX IPPJ $14.79 $20.00 $25.11 $19.95
218 47430 2 3/4" CPLG QUICKX IPPJ $14.71 $16.75 $25.11 $19.95
219 47450 Q 3/4" CPLG QUICK X FIP $11.53 $16.75 $14.33 $15.57
220 47480 3/4"  CPLG CPPJXMIP $10.97 $16.75 $13.66 $14.81
221 47480 Q 3/4"  CPLG QUICKXMIP LEAD FREE $10.97 $16.75 $13.38 $14.81
222 47500 3/4" CPLG IPPJ X MIP $13.23 $16.75 $16.42 $417.83
223 47520 3/4" 90 ELBOW CPPJ X L44-33 $17.26 $20.00 $20.06 $23.29
224 47540 3/4" X 1" CPPJ X CPPJ $15.52 $25.00 $18.18 $20.94
225 47540 Q 3/4" X 1" CPLG QUICK $15.52 $23.00 $18.18 $20.94
226 47630 3/4" TEE CPPJ $32.32 $48.00 $37.52 $43.61
227 47730 3/4" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS $1.04 $2.50 $1.72 $1.41



228 47785 Q 1" BALL CORP CCX QUICK $46.54 $69.00 $55.56 $62.81
229 47819 Q 1" CORP IP X CPPJ $36.18 $65.00 $55.56 $62.81
230 47850 1" CORP PLUG CC $8.18 $12.00 $11.99 $7.60
231 47930 1 BALL CURB FEIP LF $58.51 $85.00 $79.40 $78.95
232 48780 1.5" CPLG CPPJ X MIP $35.57 $49.00 $43.71 $33.50
233 48910 1.5" SS TUBE STIFFENER CTS $1.52 $4.75 $3.60 $2.06
234 48990 Q 2" BALL CORP CC X QUICK $172.50 $236.00 $207.39 $232.77
235 49010 Q 2" BALL CORP IP X QUICK $172.50 $236.00 $207.39 $232.77
236 49050 Q 2" BALL BURB QUICK $245.00 $335.00 $304.59 $330.57
237 49070 Q 2" BALL CURB QUICK FIP $175.22 $271.00 $310.92 $266.91
238 49080 2 2" BALL CURB FEIP $175.22 $239.00 $217.88 $236.43
239 49110 2" CPLG CPPJ X FEIP $54.19 $74.00 $66.59 $73.12
240 49150 Q 2" CPLG QUICK X MIP $51.84 $74.00 $63.67 $69.95
241 49180 Q 2" CPLG QUICK $69.01 $95.00 $84.79 $93.12
242 49500 1.5" OMNI T2 MTR TRPL 100CF NO BID $738.00 NO BID NO BID
243 49510 2" OME T2 MTR TRPL 100F NO BID $875.00 NO BID NO BID
244 49530 4" OMNI T2 METER NO BID $2,120.00 NO BID NO BID
245 49535 1 1/2" OMNI C2 METER NO BID $1,105.00 NO BID NO BID
246 49545 3" OMNI METER NO BID $1,615.00 NO BID NO BID
247 50023 5/8" SR ECR MTR 100CF W/PAD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
248 50047 5/8" X 3/4" SR ECR MTR 100CF W/PAD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
249 50063 ECR TOUCH PAD NO BID $9.95 NO BID NO BID
250 50069 METER WIRE-#FEET NO BID $0.29 NO BID $0.20
251 50096 5/8" METER GASKET $0.15 $0.29 NO BID $0.09
252 50133 3/4" SR ECR MTR 100 CF W/PAD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
253 50152 1" SR ECR MTR 100CF W/[AD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
254 50196 3/4" METER RUBBER GASKET 10D $0.17 $0.39 NO BID $0.12
255 50203 1" METER GASKETS $1.25 $0.39 NO BID $0.15
256 50285 1 1/2"  BRONZE METER FLANGE $31.70 $78.06 NO BID $42.78
257 50300 5/8"  IPERL MTR F 2W TR/PL NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
258 50300 1 5/8" IPERL MTR G 2W TR/PL NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
259 50300 21 5/8"X3/4" IPERL G 32 DIRECT MOUTN NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
260 50300 24 5/8"X3/4"  IPERL F 3W DIRECT MOUNT NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
261 50300 24S 5/8"X3/4"/4 IPERL SMT MTR F 3W DIRE NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
262 50300 5 3/4"  S IPERL MTR F 2W 5/8 LL NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
263 50300 82S 1 IPER SMT MTR F 3W DIR MOUNT NO BID $185.00 NO BID $0.60
264 50305 1 1/2" METER GASKET $1.75 $3.25 NO BID NO BID
265 50307 510M 510M NP SP TC W/LD&HR NO BID $145.00 NO BID NO BID
266 50315 5.8" X 2 1/2" PLATED NUTS & BOTLS $4.50 $0.99 NO BID NO BID



267 50323 MXU 510R NP SINGLE PORT TC W/ITR NO BID $149.00 NO BID NO BID
268 50395 3 HYD METER SF W/C SCREEN NO BID $1,450.00 NO BID NO BID
269 50485 6" METER FLG BR NO BID $300.00 NO BID NO BID
270 50825 1.5" TURBO REG ECR 100 CF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
271 51254 4 1.25 X 1" DUAL CHECK 41-4JF54 NO BID $115.00 NO BID NO BID
272 52033 5/8" KORNERHORN BALL VALVE 1-3 $34.60 $41.00 NO BID NO BID
273 52035 3/4" #7 DCBF PREV 103K L/C NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID
274 52049 3/4"  METER DCBF PREV 3/4 FEIP LF NO BID $45.00 NO BID NO BID
275 52049 3/4" METER DCBF PREV X PJLC NO BID $45.00 NO BID NO BID
276 52050 1/2"  CP SETTER PACK JOINT 1-3K $9.67 $13.25 NO BID NO BID
277 52070 Q 3/4" P SETTER QUICK JOINT 1-3K $8.78 $12.00 NO BID NO BID
278 52090 1" CP SETTER PACK JOINT 103K $11.02 $15.00 NO BID NO BID
279 52330 3/4" METER CONNECT $7.12 $10.75 NO BID NO BID
280 52360 5/8" X 3/4" METER BUSHING $11.94 $4.00 NO BID NO BID
281 52370 5/8" X 3/4" METER ADPT RING $3.63 $4.00 NO BID NO BID
282 52570 5/8"X3/4"  #2 KORNER HORN LEAD FRE$38.67 $49.50 NO BID NO BID
283 52570 5/8" X 3/4" KNR HORN LC NO BID $49.50 NO BID NO BID
284 52700 3/4"  METER CONN 3/4 MIP LEAD FREE$7.12 $9.75 NO BID NO BID
285 52700 3/4" METER CONN 3/4" MIP $3.12 $9.75 NO BID NO BID
286 52733 3/4"  90 METER CON 3/4 MIP LEAD FR $10.47 $14.50 NO BID NO BID
287 52733 3/4" 90 METER CONN 3/4" MIP $10.47 $14.50 NO BID NO BID
288 52780 3/4" K HORN $42.88 $55.00 NO BID NO BID
289 52960 3/4" X 1" VALVE HANDLE ST NO BID $4.45 NO BID NO BID
290 52980 1" #4 KORNERHORN L/C $79.82 $104.00 NO BID NO BID
291 52985 1" #7 DCBF 4K L/C USE 102 PJ NO BID $121.00 NO BID NO BID
292 53220 1" METER CONN 1 MIP $12.00 $19.50 NO BID NO BID
293 54060 RM 3/4X3 LEAK CLAMP 105 $10.62 $9.75 $8.38 NO BID
294 54070 F 3/4" X 6" LEAK CLAMP 105 $22.68 $12.25 $16.34 NO BID
295 54080 R 3/4"X5"  2 BOLT STEEL CPLG 105 NO BID $28.00 $22.22 NO BID
296 54080 F 3/4" X 5 BOLT CPLG 105 $17.43 $36.00 $22.22 NO BID
297 54080 RM 3/4" 5" BOLT CPLG 105 NO BID $28.00 $22.22 NO BID
298 54140 1" 2 BOLT COUPLING $19.00 $17.00 NO BID NO BID
299 54142 RM 3" X 5" BOLT CPLG 132 NO BID $67.00 $42.63 NO BID
300 54170 F 1.25" X 3" LEAK CLAMP $11.61 $8.00 $7.08 NO BID
301 54180 RM 1.25" X 6" LEAK CLAMP NO BID $33.00 $13.20 NO BID
302 54190 RM 1.25 X 6" LEAK CLAMP 166 $23.06 $33.00 $13.20 NO BID
303 54220 RM 1.5" X 3" LEAK CLAMP 190 $11.85 $11.25 $7.60 NO BID
304 54240 R 1 1/2" X 5" 2  BOLT STEEL CPLG NO BID $39.50 $17.25 NO BID
305 54242 RM 1 1/2" X 5" BOLT CPLG 190 NO BID $39.50 $42.63 NO BID



306 54271 RM 2" X 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 253263 $32.38 $57.50 $57.63 NO BID
307 54310 RM 2" X 12" SS1 REP CLAMP 235263 $96.16 $99.75 $95.85 NO BID
308 54320 1 1/2" X 6" LEAK CLAMP $23.34 $19.95 $17.25 NO BID
309 54330 RM 2"X6" LEAK CLAMP 238 $23.96 $22.25 $15.05 NO BID
310 54331 RM 2"X6" LEAK CLAMP FULL WRAP 238 NO BID $60.50 $41.48 NO BID
311 54470 RM 2" X 5" BOLT STEEL CPLG 23B $28.74 $48.25 $41.48 NO BID
312 54472 RM 2"X5" LEAK CLAMP 238 OD NO BID $48.25 $15.05 NO BID
313 54970 RM 4" X 12" SS1 REP CLAMP 474514 $56.05 $115.00 $113.35 NO BID
314 55564 RM 4" X 5" DI CPLG NO BID $69.00 $111.03 NO BID
315 55574 RM 4"X7" XR501 DUCT CPLG 450-560 NO BID $92.00 $154.68 NO BID
316 55575 RM 4" X 6" MACRO CLPG 440560 NO BID $179.00 $157.56 NO BID
317 5600 4" GLAG ADAPTER NO BID $166.00 $27.48 NO BID
318 55700 RM 7"X8" SS1REPA CLAMP 684724 $45.39 $89.00 NO BID NO BID
319 55730 RM 6X12 SS1 REP CLAMP $72.56 $139.00 NO BID NO BID
320 55745 6" X 12" SSI REP CLAMP 3.4" CC 684724$85.53 $163.00 $193.51 NO BID
321 55780 RM 6" X 16" SS1 RED CLAMP 684724 $80.05 $153.00 NO BID NO BID
322 55780 RM 6" X 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 684724 $45.39 $89.00 $93.02 NO BID
323 55937 RM 6" X12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4" CC 684724$85.53 $165.00 $130.03 NO BID
324 55946 RM 6" X 12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 1CC 684724 $85.53 $165.00 NO BID NO BID
325 56020 RM 6" 8" SS1  TAP CLAMP 2CC 684724 $72.23 $135.00 NO BID NO BID
326 56059 RM 6" 202N SADDLE 3/4" CC $23.99 $85.00 $61.39 NO BID
327 56267 RM 6" 202N SADDLE 2C 663760 $29.21 $92.00 NO BID NO BID
328 56378 RM 6"X6" MACRO CPLG 660760 NO BID $238.00 $206.28 NO BID
329 56378 6" STYLE 262 HYMAX CPLG 622-748 $320.00 NO BID $206.28 NO BID
330 56384 RM 6" X 5 " CPLG 686720 NO BID $95.00 NO BID NO BID
331 56570 RM 8X"8" SS1 REP CLAMP 900940 $50.18 $99.00 NO BID NO BID
332 56604 RM 8" X 12" SS1 REP CLAMP $78.01 $165.00 $117.09 NO BID
333 56640 RM 6" 16" SS1 REP CLAMP OP 900940 $89.17 $189.00 $268.44 NO BID
334 56781 8" X 8" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4" CC $67.85 $170.00 NO BID NO BID
335 56783 8" X 12" SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4CC $97.20 $170.00 $149.95 NO BID
336 56831 RM 8" 202N SADDLE 3/4" CC $26.26 $105.00 $71.36 NO BID
337 56988 RM 8" X 1.5" IP SS DOUBLE STRAP SADDL $63.60 $105.00 $76.08 NO BID
338 57139 RM 8" X 6" MACRO CPLG 860975 NO BID $265.00 $116.14 NO BID
339 57139 8" HYMAX $340.00 NO BID $219.59 NO BID
340 57150 8" X 5" DUCT CPLG 899940 NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
341 57270 F 8' F BELL CLAMP 905930 $82.46 $279.00 NO BID NO BID
342 57325 RM 10" X 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 11041144 $67.02 $139.00 $288.01 NO BID
343 57361 RM 10" X 12" SSI REP CLAMP 11041144 $105.32 $175.00 $139.54 NO BID
344 57400 RM 10" X 15" F SS REP CLMP $121.07 $198.00 $194.19 NO BID



345 57476 RM 10: X 12" SS REP CLAMP 11401220 $105.32 $310.00 $142.46 NO BID
346 57812 RM 10" F CLAMP 202 SADDLE NO BID $130.00 $86.20 NO BID
347 57813 RM 10" 202N SADDLE 100111C NO BID $130.00 $86.20 NO BID
348 57849 10" STYLE 262 HYMAX CPLG 10701200 $480.00 NO BID $304.67 NO BID
349 57897 RM 10"X6" MACRO CPLG 10701190 NO BID $349.00 $161.24 NO BID
350 57898 10" X 6" DI CPLG 10891140 NO BID $366.00 $161.24 NO BID
351 57930 10" BELL CLAMP $103.36 $310.00 $279.12 NO BID
352 58005 RM 13" X 8" SS1 REP CLAMP 13151355 NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID
353 58020 RM 12" X 10" SS REP CLAMP 14001440 $100.67 $279.00 NO BID NO BID
354 58068 RM 12" 12" SS REP CLAMP 12701310 $121.87 $269.00 $188.53 NO BID
355 58070 RM 12"X12" SS1 REP CLAMP 13151355 $121.87 $249.00 $283.83 NO BID
356 58110 RM 12" X 16" REP CLAMP 12701310 $137.76 $325.00 $374.75 NO BID
357 58111 RM 12" 16" SS REP CLAMP 13151355 $137.76 $325.00 $322.84 NO BID
358 58240 RM 12" X 16" REP CLAMP 1315395 NO BID $402.00 $489.39 NO BID
359 58355 RM 12" 202N SADDLE 3/4" CC $40.73 $139.00 $100.32 NO BID
360 58438 RM 12" 202N SADDLE 1CC $40.73 $139.00 $100.32 NO BID
361 58496 RM 12" 202N SADDLE 1.5" CC 13201438 $51.44 $149.00 $107.45 NO BID
362 58511 RM 12" 202N SADDLE 1.5" IP 130201438 $51.44 $149.00 $107.45 NO BID
363 58566 RM 12V 202N SADDLE 2CC 13201439 $51.44 $149.00 $114.94 NO BID
364 58601 RM 12" X 6 MACRO CPLG 13151440 NO BID $485.00 $432.38 NO BID
365 58643 RM 12"x6" MACRO CPLG 13151440 NO BID $485.00 $432.38 NO BID
366 58690 RM 12" BELL CLAMP $119.60 $335.00 $301.91 NO BID
367 58760 RM 14" X 16" SS REP CLAMP $222.49 $545.00 NO BID NO BID
368 58892 RM 14" X 7" DUCT CPLG 15301570 NO BID $339.00 $326.65 NO BID
369 58932 16" X 16" SS REP CLAMP $243.53 $702.00 $1,245.95 NO BID
370 59031 RM 16" 7 DI CPLG 17401780 NO BID $403.00 $434.46 NO BID
371 59050 RM 16" BELL CLAMP 17401780 NO BID $1,750.00 $471.43 NO BID
372 61360 6" MUNI BALL NO BID $175.00 $183.46 NO BID
373 61370 8" MUNI BALL NO BID $210.00 $230.88 NO BID
374 62113 1 24" PAMREX DI MH F&C SEWER NO BID $399.00 NO BID NO BID
375 62113 2 24" PAMREX DI MH F & C DRAIN NO BID $399.00 NO BID NO BID
376 62113 32S 32" PAMEX DI MH F & C SEWER NO BID $675.00 NO BID NO BID
377 62113 32D 32" PAMREX DI MH F & C DRAIN NO BID $675.00 NO BID NO BID
378 62114 6 24" REXEL DI CB FRAME & GRATE NO BID $225.00 NO BID NO BID
379 62114 CB4 24" REXUS DI SQ CB F & G 4 FLG HNG NO BID $436.00 NO BID NO BID
380 62114 CB3R 24" REXUS DI SQ CB F & G 3FLG HNG NO BID $436.00 NO BID NO BID
381 62234 4" FLEX CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC $4.74 $5.75 $4.76 NO BID
382 62326 6" FLEX CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC NO BID $11.45 $9.44 NO BID  
383 68829 1 8 NYLOPLASTE DI DROP IN GRATE NO BID $55.00 $47.12 NO BID



384 69140 KEN SEAL FOR CONCRET MH NO BID $10.00 NO BID NO BID
385 78249 12" SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE NO BID $8.30 $5.11 NO BID
386 78259 15" SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE NO BID $10.75 $6.57 NO BID
387 78269 18" SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE NO BID $11.20 $10.21 NO BID
388 78279 24" SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE NO BID $16.65 $15.33 NO BID
389 78284 30" SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT TITE NO BID $38.95 $24.22 NO BID
390 78287 36" SURE-LOK PE PIPE ISLT0TITE NO BID $48.90 $28.02 NO BID
391 85985 2 LTL GULP HYDRANT PUMP NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID
392 86587 1 14"X1" EJP BLADE TIGER TOOTH NO BID $275.00 NO BID NO BID
393 87025 PRESCOTT PLG HYDAULIC CEMENT NO BID $45.00 NO BID NO BID
394 90360 BENCH TEST METER NO BID $150.00 NO BID NO BID
395 91460 SPOT MARKER PAINT APPLICATOR NO BID $35.00 NO BID NO BID
396 91808 5 360X 12.5 NW FABRIC 8 OZ NO BID $1.05 NO BID NO BID
397 91808 5 300 X 1 NONWOVEN FABRIC 8 OZ NO BID $1.05 NO BID NO BID
398 91808 33 360 X 3 NONWOVEN FABRIC 4 OZ NO BID $0.76 NO BID NO BID
399 91808 34 360 X   NONWOVEN FABRIC 4 OZ NO BID $0.76 NO BID NO BID
400 91808 6 360" 12.  NONWOVEN FABRIC 4.5 OZ NO BID $0.89 NO BID NO BID
401 91808 62 360 X 1 NONWOVEN FABRIC 4 1/2" OZ NO BID $0.89 NO BID NO BID
402 91809 360X 1 WOVEN FABRIC 200 NO BID $0.76 NO BID NO BID
403 91809 10 15X 300 WOVEN FABRIC W300 NO BID $0.89 NO BID NO BID
404 91809 3 432 X 12.5 WOVEN FABRIC 200 NO BID $0.89 NO BID NO BID
405 91809 9 360 X 12.5 WOVEN FABRIC 300 NO BID $1.05 $116.14 NO BID
406 570150 RM 8" X 6" MACRO CPLG 860975 NO BID $265.00 NO BID NO BID
407 N 528161 KENNEDY O-RING K8126 NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID
408 N1148927 1.836 12" X 3/4" CPPJ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
409 N1148929 RH GAKET LEATHER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
410 N1148930 MS GASKET LEATHER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
411 N1148931 5/8" GASKET LEATHER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
412 N1209078 K81 D DRAIN VALVE K8136W NO BID $369.00 NO BID NO BID
413 N1209079 K8128 SEAT RING NO BID $359.00 NO BID NO BID
414 N1209080 K8131 MAIN VALVE NO BID $99.00 NO BID NO BID
415 N1209081 DRAN VALVE FACING NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
416 N1215188 K81 LOWER BARREL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
417 N1215189 6' ROD OPEN RIGH NO BID $159.00 NO BID NO BID
418 N1253322 K81 5.25" BR SEAT RING N/D NO BID $350.00 NO BID NO BID
419 N1253451 RK909CK1 4"-BF RMS NO BID $675.00 NO BID NO BID
420 N1253452 RK909 CK2 4" BF RMS NO BID $675.00 NO BID NO BID
421 N1253453 RK909M1VT 4" BF RMS NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID
422 N528159 KENNEDY REP KIT F8149 NO BID $225.00 NO BID NO BID



423 N528160 KENNEDY O-RING K8130 NO BID $8.00 NO BID NO BID
424 N528162 KENNEDY MAIN VALVE K9131 NO BID $99.00 NO BID NO BID
425 N528162B KENNEDY BRONZE SEAT RING K8128 NO BID $349.00 NO BID NO BID
426 NO1313130 SS4-33 00X30 SS REP CLAMP NO BID $2,650.00 NO BID NO BID
427 NO1323392 6" X 12" SS REPAIR CLAMP $66.35 $140.00 NO BID NO BID
428 NO1469567 1 1/4" BALL CURB $115.39 $180.00 NO BID NO BID
429 NO1479052 1 1/2" OMNI T2 REGISTER NO BID $260.00 NO BID NO BID
430 NO1479053 1125-W HYD METER REGISTER NO BID $190.00 NO BID NO BID
431 NO148484899 5/8" X 3/4" RESETTER NO BID $190.00 NO BID NO BID
432 NON01525180 2" XCLOSE SS NIPPLE 304 NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID
433 NON01525181 2"  SS BALL VALVE 1PXIP NO BID $280.00 NO BID NO BID
434 NON01531561 5' FIBR SPRING FLAG W/REFL BANDS NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID
435 NON01550036 1"X3/4" BALL CURB CPPJXIP T LF $47.65 $105.00 NO BID NO BID
436 RH1401 METER ADAP 5/8"X3/4"  RH NO BID $18.00 NO BID NO BID
437 RH1425 METER DWNSIZE ADAP 5/8"X3/4"-3/4" $7.57 $29.00 NO BID NO BID
438 RH200404 1.5" BRONZE MTR FLG SET RED HED NO BID $95.00 NO BID NO BID
439 RH200404P 1 1/2"  BRONZE MTR FLG SET RED HE NO BID $95.00 NO BID NO BID
440 RH45011 ADAPT LED COMP 5/8" X 3/4" RH NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
441 RH45031 ADT LEAD COMP MS X 3/4" RH NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
442 RH45032 ADPT LEAD COMP RHX 3/5" NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
443 RH45051 ADPT LEAD COMP RH X 3/4" NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
445 22010 2 RT PVC PIPE CL 160 238 DSR 26 NO BID $0.75 NO BID NO BID
446 23030 2 RT PVC 45 ELBOW NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID
447 25605 18" X 13" RT PVC SEWER PIPE F-679 NO BID $22.75 $17.59 NO BID
448 25615 18"X4" RT PVC BXB WYE SER NO BID $576.00 $493.86 NO BID
449 25700 24" RT PVC SEWER PIPE F-679 NO BID $40.00 $52.56 NO BID
450 27010 1 4"X13" RT PVC SWR PIPE SDR34 NO BID $1.50 $1.13 NO BID
451 27020 2 6"13" RT PVC SWR PIPE NO BID $2.50 $2.25 NO BID
452 27030 1 8"X13" RT PVC SWR PIPE SDR35 NO BID $4.50 $3.99 NO BID
453 27040 2 10"X13" RT PVC SWR PIPE SDR35 NO BID $6.75 $6.91 NO BID
454 27060 4' RT PVC BXB WYE SWR NO BID $10.50 $9.51 NO BID
455 27062 4' RT PVC BXB TEE WYE SWR NO BID $11.90 $10.60 NO BID
456 27065 4' RT PVC 8"X8" 90 ELBOW SWR NO BID $8.00 $6.93 NO BID
457 27070 4' RT PVC BXS 90 ELBOW SWR NO BID $7.50 $6.38 NO BID
458 27075 4' RT PVC BXB 45 ELBOW SWR NO BID $7.50 $5.51 NO BID
459 27080 4' RT PVC BXS 45 ELBOW SWR NO BID $6.25 $4.46 NO BID
460 27090 4' RT PVC BXS 22 1/2" ELBOW SWR NO BID $6.25 $5.25 NO BID
461 27100 4"X6" RT PVC REDUCER BXS SWR NO BID $13.00 $9.91 NO BID
462 27105 4" RT PVC END PLUG SWR NO BID $3.75 $2.69 NO BID  



463 27108 4" PLASTIC GRIPPER PLUG NO BID $10.50 $7.06 NO BID
464 27110 4" RT PVC END CAP SWR NO BID $3.90 $3.56 NO BID
465 27113 4" CLEAN OUT ADAPT W/PLUG NO BID $4.75 $8.64 NO BID
466 27120 6RT PVC BXB TEE SWR NO BID $22.00 $21.94 NO BID
467 27160 6" RT PVC BXB 45" ELBOW SWR NO BID $13.00 $11.19 NO BID
468 27165 6" 45 DEGREE PVC BX5 NO BID $13.00 $9.91 NO BID
469 27170 6" RT PVC 8"X8" 22 1/2" ELBOW SWR NO BID $12.75 $10.83 NO BID
470 27175 6" 22 1/2" PVC BXS NO BID $12.75 $10.29 NO BID
471 27188 6" PLASTIC GRIPPER PLUG NO BID $19.00 $19.22 NO BID
472 27206 8"X6" TEE WYE PVC BXB NO BID $38.00 .36.16 NO BID
473 27230 8"X6" RT PVC BXB WYE SWR NO BID $38.00 $34.26 NO BID
474 27250 8" RT PVC BXB 90 ELBOW SWR NO BID $39.00 $35.28 NO BID
475 56106 RM 6" 202N SADDLE BL STRAP 1"CC NO BID $89.00 $61.39 NO BID
476 58355 RM 12" 202N SADDLE 3/4CC 13201438 NO BID $140.00 $100.32 NO BID
477 58985 1RM 16" 202N SADDLE 1CC 17401890 NO BID $195.00 $144.34 NO BID
478 61358 4" MUNI BALL NO BID $135.00 $156.00 NO BID
479 62195 4" QUIK CAP $6.08 $399.50 $6.40 NO BID
480 62217 4"X3" FLEX CPLG CLAY-PVC NO BID $755.00 $4.88 NO BID
481 62218 4"X3" FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC NO BID $2.75 $4.75 NO BID
482 62234 4" FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC $4.74 $6.50 $4.76 NO BID
483 62245 4" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC $4.41 $7.50 $4.41 NO BID
484 62247 4" FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC $4.38 $7.50 $4.41 NO BID
485 62309 6" FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC $9.02 $150.00 $10.20 NO BID
486 62314 6" FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC $9.37 $14.00 $9.44 NO BID
487 62315 6"X4" FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC $8.25 $16.50 $11.09 NO BID
488 62317 6"X4" FLEX CPLG CLAY-PVC $10.78 $16.50 $11.09 NO BID
489 62326 6" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC $9.38 $14.00 $9.44 NO BID
490 62337 6"X4" FLEX CPLG PVC X PVC $11.00 $16.50 $11.09 NO BID
491 62449 8"X6" FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/KI-CI/PVC $18.00 $26.00 $19.44 NO BID
492 62453 8" FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC $16.23 $24.00 $15.69 NO BID
493 62455 8"X6" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-AC/DI NO BID $24.00 $81.52 NO BID
494 62456 8" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-AC/DI NO BID $26.00 $18.69 NO BID
495 62458 8" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC $14.14 $26.00 $14.53 NO BID
496 62475 10" FLEX CPLG PVCXPVC $19.50 $33.00 $21.80 NO BID
497 62477 10" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC $21.66 $33.00 $21.80 NO BID
498 62524 12" FLEX CPLG PVC-PVC $25.00 $39.00 $25.45 NO BID
499 62528 12" FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC $24.80 $39.00 $25.45 NO BID
500 62651 4" PVCX6 PVC INSERTA TEE NO BID $98.00 $57.58 NO BID
501 62651 1 4" PVC 8 PVC INSERTA TEE NO BID $105.00 $55.78 NO BID



502 62651 2 4" PVCX10PVC INSERTA TEE NO BID $105.00 $67.88 NO BID
503 62651 3 4" PVCX 12 PVC INSERTA TEE NO BID $105.00 $57.88 NO BID
504 62653 2 4" PVC 8 AC INSERTA TEE NO BID $115.00 $57.78 NO BID
505 62653 3 4" PVC 10 AC INSERTA TEE NO BID $115.00 $67.88 NO BID
506 62653 4 4" PVCX12 AC INSERTA TEE NO BID $115.00 $67.88 NO BID
507 62654 4" INSERTA TEE NO BID $115.00 NO BID NO BID
508 62655 PVC 12" PVC INSERTA TEE NO BID $125.00 NO BID NO BID
509 62657 5 6" PVCX12AC INSERTA TEE NO BID $160.00 $87.27 NO BID
510 62891 6-12"X4" FLEX SWR TEE SADDLE $37.32 $65.00 $43.50 NO BID
511 62892 6 12"X4" FLEX SWR WYE SADDLE $34.50 $59.00 $54.27 NO BID
512 62893 9- 12"X6" FLOEX SWR TEE SADDLE NO BID $60.00 $55.20 NO BID
513 62894 8-12"X6" FLEX SWR WYE SADDLE NO BID $70.00 $70.70 NO BID
514 63196 4 FT T HANDLE SB WRNCH PENT $25.00 $45.00 NO BID NO BID
515 63202 1 5T HANDLE SB WRENCH ROD END $26.00 $55.00 NO BID NO BID
516 63286 3-12 PIPE CLEANER / DESCALER NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID
517 65039 24" CB GRATE ROUND L24G1 NO BID $149.00 NO BID NO BID
518 65041 24"X6" MH FRAME LA246 NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID
519 65100 24" MH COVER SEWER L24C1 NO BID $140.00 NO BID NO BID
520 65206 CASCADE CB FRAME LK450 NO BID $310.00 NO BID NO BID
521 65207 CASCADE CB GRATE L2422G1 NO BID $350.00 NO BID NO BID
522 66100 24"X1" MH RISER RING LER2420-4 NO BID $165.00 NO BID NO BID
523 66100 2 24"X2 MH RISER RING LER2420-5 NO BID $189.00 NO BID NO BID
524 271010 1 4"X13 RT PVC SWR PIPE SDR35 NO BID $1.25 $1.13 NO BID
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