Forum

Article |Brief Description Neptunes's Lawmans Gall's Direct Officer Store
PACKAGE #1
Long sleeve 100% polyester or polyester blend shirt, navy blue or white, zipper front, double patched, 1 % inch gold on black
slanted hash marks as needed. Stitched buttonholes on shirt for placement of brass or silver buttons. Brass or silver NH seal
1/buttons included (1 Set). Vendor to provide name of manufacturer of item bid. $47.00 NO BID $33.00 [NOBID $53.48 -POLY, $68.03 BLEND
Short sleeve 100% polyester or polyester blend shirt, navy blue or white, zipper front, double patched. Stitched buttonholes
on shirt for placement of brass or silver buttons. Brass or silver NH seal buttons included. Vendor to provide name of
2|manufacturer of item bid. $45.00 NO BID $31.00  [NOBID $49.85 -POLY $63.83 BLEND
Pants, navy blue 100% polyester or polyester blend 6 pocket & 8 pocket with 1-inch royal blue braid from bottom of belt loop
to toe. Command officer pants with % inch black braid overlapping blue braid. Vendor to provide name of manufacturer of |6. ¢55.00
3item bid. 8- $62.00 NO BID $55.00  [NOBID $49.04- 6, $75.04 - 8
Uniform hat, round, button down with strap and silver or gold cloth band. Summer and Winter price. Vendor to provide $45 - Summer
4|name of manufacturer of item bid. $50 - winter NO BID $60.00  [NOBID $66.83 W/STRAP
5|Black baseball hat with gold “POLICE” embroidery. $14.50 NO BID $7.90 NO BID $9.50
6|Black standard size tie, clip on $4.00 NO BID $4.00 NO BID $3.35
7|Black short tie, clip on $4.00 NO BID $4.00 NO BID $3.10
8|Rain Cover to match above rain jacket for above button down uniform hat. $10.00 NO BID NOBID |NOBID $7.00 (reversible)
9|Search Gloves. Currently have Damascus #DS2000 $32.00 NO BID $24.00 [NOBID $27.85
Zip front breakaway safety vest, ANSI certified class I1 high visibility yellow, microphone tabs on both sides, breathable mesh
10[background fabric, “POLICE” lettering down front left side and across lower back. $42.00 NO BID $36.00 [NOBID $39.00
Black BDU polyester or polyester blend top, long sleeve, front chest pockets with hook and loop closures, nylon canvas,
11|Currently issue 5.11 Tactical. RPD patch over left breast pocket. Vendor to provide name of manufacturer of item bid. $29.00 NO BID $27.00 _[NOBID $43.92
Black BDU pants, nylon canvas, comfort-fit waistband, double knee and seat. Currently issue 5.11 Tactical. Vendor to
12|provide name of manufacturer of item bid. $29.00 NO BID $27.00 [NOBID $39.65
13|Shoes low cut, hi gloss black, currently have Bates. $100 NO BID $60.00  [NOBID $89.21
Single breasted, 4 button, 4 pocket, Navy Dress Jacket with Matching Dress Pants, Jacket to include piping on epaulets and
14|top pockets and brass NH State Seal buttons. Pants will include a 1/2 inch braid overlapping a 1 inch braid. $325.00 NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
15. Turtleneck, polyester or polyester blend, embroidered, RPD offset on collar $26.00 NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID $21.06
16. Mock turtleneck, polyester or polyester blend, embroidered offset on collar $26.00 NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID $19.90
17|Brass or silver NH seal buttons $1.25 per NO BID NOBID  |NOBID $1.00
18|Boullion Hash marks $6.00 per NO BID NOBID _ [NOBID $10.00

PACKAGE #2




19|2 ¥4 inch Sam Browne Belt, high gloss, four row stitching, full lined with silver or gold hardware. $70.00 $48.84 $60.00  [NOBID NO BID
20|Silver or brass belt buckle for above belt $9.00 $1.72 $10.00  [NOBID NO BID
21{2 ¥, inch Sally Browne Belt, high gloss, four row stitching, full lined with silver or gold hardware. $70.00 $51.38 NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
22|Silver or brass belt buckle for above belt with velcor belt tips $9.00 $1.72 NOBID [NOBID NO BID
23|1 ¥ inch garrison belt high gloss w/ buckle silver/gold. $30.00 $34.44 $27.00 [NOBID NO BID
24|1 ¥, inch garrison belt matte finish w/buckle silver/gold $22.00 $22.76 $26.00 |[NOBID NO BID
25|1 ¥ inch garrison belt matte finish velcro $25.00 $24.09 $26.00 [NOBID NO BID
26Safariland ALS off duty holster for Glock 21 or Glock 30 .45 cal STX Plain $80.00 NO BID $108.00 |[NOBID NO BID
27|Safariland ALS holster for Glock 21 or Glock 30 .45 cal STX high gloss $170.00 NO BID $135.00 [NOBID NO BID
28|Safariland Double Magazine Pouch STX High gloss $36.00 NO BID $37.00 |[NOBID NO BID
29|High Gloss double handcuff case for Peerless hinged handcuffs with silver or brass snap. $40.00 $33.29 $37.00 [NOBID NO BID
30[High Gloss Single Handcuff case holder $26.00 $25.57 $29.00 [NOBID NO BID
31|{High Gloss handcuff loop holder with silver or brass hardware. $11.00 $9.35 $9.50 NO BID NO BID
32[High Gloss single belt keeper with silver or brass snap. $3.25 $3.58 $4.00 NO BID NO BID
33|High Gloss double belt keeper with silver or brass snap. $6.50 $6.49 $6.00 NO BID NO BID
34|High Gloss OC spray carry case. Strong Part #A56602 $27.00 $23.81 $29.00 |[NOBID NO BID
35|Black belt badge holder for detective use. $11.50 $7.88 NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
Garel G22 Breast Badge with “ROCHESTER’ across the bottom and “PATROLMAN" across the top. All letters in black.
36/N.H. State Seal and “POLICE” wi/blue filler. Silver $45.00 $40.36 NOBID _ |NOBID NO BID
37|Above badge in gold and silver with wallet clip $45.00 $45.70-G $40.36 - S NOBID [NOBID NO BID
38|Gold breast badge. Same as above for Chief, Deputy Chief, Captain, Lieutenant, Sergeant, and Detective. $45.00 $45.70 NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
39|Silver hat badge. Garel G83 w/coco. N.H. state seal, numbered cut out. $41.95 $40.36 NOBID [NOBID NO BID
40|Gold hat badge. Garel G83 w/coco. N.H. state seal with lettered Sergeant, Lieutenant, Captain, Deputy Chief or Chief. $41.95 $45.70 NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
41{Gold or Silver name tag with block letters in black. Reeves 800 clutch back, high polished. $11.50 $9.52 $8.00 NO BID NO BID
42|Silver collar pins “RPD” ¥%2”. Price per set. $9.50 $9.50 NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
43|Gold sergeant chevrons $7.00 $4.34/PR WITH MINIMUM $4.38 NO BID NO BID
44|Gold lieutenant bars $7.00 $4.34/PR WITH MINIMUM $7.50 NO BID NO BID
45|Gold captain bars $7.00 $4.34/PR WITH MINIMUM $7.50 NO BID NO BID
46|Gold chief stars (4) or Gold Deputy Chief stars (3) $15.00 $14.52 & $11.15/PR WITH MINIMUM _ [$10.00  [NO BID NO BID
47|Gold or Silver tie bar for male or female with state seal and “Rochester Police” in black $18.00 $16.58 $17.00  [NOBID NO BID
48|9 different Blackington Cloth Ribbons with clutch back $2.50 NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
49|Ribbon holders for 1 through 9 ribbons $1.25 NO BID NOBID [NOBID NO BID
s50/Small N.H. seal silver button $1.00 NO BID NOBID _ |NOBID NO BID
51/Small N.H. seal gold button $1.00 NO BID NOBID [NOBID NO BID
s52|Large N.H. seal. silver button $1.10 NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
s3|Large N.H. seal gold button $1.25 NO BID NOBID [NOBID NO BID
s4[Silver or gold N.H. seal hat buttons $1.50 NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
55/Subdued Chief-4 stars, Deputy Chief-3 stars, Captain & Lieutenant bars, collared Sergeant Chevrons $10.95 NO BID $10.00 |[NOBID NO BID
56|3 D-Cell flashlight $25.00 NO BID $24.50  [NOBID NO BID
57|Streamlight Stinger flashlight w/charger AC75001 $140.00 NO BID $88.00 |[NOBID NO BID
58|High gloss open top stinger holder for duty belt $19.00 $20.03 $28.00 [NOBID NO BID
59|Sabre Red 10% O.C. spray. 1.8 ounce canister $13.00 NO BID $12.00 [NOBID NO BID
60| Auto-lock 22 inch Monadnock Expandable Baton w/power tip $145.00 NO BID $110.00 [NOBID NO BID
61{Monadnock Expandable Baton holder for duty belt $31.00 $21.94 $26.00 |[NOBID NO BID
62|Peerless hinged handcuffs/silver $37.00 NO BID $31.00  [NOBID NO BID
63|Black Street Pro Gear duty bag $40.00 NO BID $36.00 |[NOBID NO BID
Metal ticket tin, heavy-duty aluminum, clip with swivel license holder, velcro wrap-around strap, top opening, 11 %2” H x 6
64|%2” W x 2 %" D, silver. $25.00 NO BID $15.00 [NOBID NO BID
65/Metal report tin $27.00 NO BID NOBID _ |NOBID NO BID
66|Silver cloth hat band $7.00 NO BID NOBID  |NOBID NO BID
67|Gold cloth hat band $7.00 NO BID NOBID _ |NOBID NO BID
68|Sergeant chevron embroidered patch/Gold on black $2.00 NO BID $3.00 NO BID NO BID
69|Sergeant chevron patch/ blue on black with white outline around blue $2.00 NO BID $3.00 NO BID NO BID
70{Gold on black 1 % hash mark patch $1.00 NO BID NOBID [NOBID NO BID
71|Blue on black with white around blue 1 % hash mark patch $1.00 NO BID NOBID  [NOBID NO BID
72|Rochester Police Shoulder Patch 500 count/embroidered on black cloth $2.00 NO BID NOBID  |NOBID NO BID
73|Flat black leather handcuff/magazine pouch case for plainclothes detective use (current model ZLP019) $55.00 $25.95 $36.00 [NOBID NO BID
74(Silver “FTO” collar pin $9.00 $9.50 $7.50 NO BID NO BID
PACKAGE #3
75|Black fleece-lined knit winter cap with gold “POLICE” embroidery. $12.00 NO BID $15.00 |[NOBID $30.20




Black Fleece-lined VV-neck sweater, polyester/wool/acrylic blend w badge tab, epaulets, name tab, microphone tab. Double
patched

$95.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$52.27

7

Lightweight, windproof, highly water resistant, fleece lined, three layer (GORE® WINDSTOPPER® fabric laminate or
equivalent) soft shell Patrol Style jacket with two chest pockets and two lower pockets (all zippers water infiltration resistant),
full-length water-resistant front zipper, side zippers for weapons access, adjustable wrist tabs. Rochester PD Shoulder patches
on both sleeves. (To be centered on shoulder. Patches to be supplied by Rochester PD). Epaulets added on both shoulders.
Badge Tab on left breast. Side zippers for weapons access.

$110.00

NO BID

NO BID

$185.00

$107.79

78

Lightweight, waterproof, windproof breathable (GORE-TEX® laminate fabric or equivalent) Patrol Style Jacket. Two chest
pockets, two lower pockets, (all zippers water infiltration resistant), full-length water-resistant front zipper, side zippers for
weapons access, adjustable wrist tabs. Rochester PD Shoulder patches on both sleeves. (To be centered on shoulder. Patches
to be supplied by Rochester PD). Epaulets added on both shoulders. Badge Tab on left breast. Side zippers for weapons
access.

NO BID

NO BID

$185.00

$158.13

7

©

Lightweight, waterproof, windproof breathable (GORE-TEX® laminate fabric or equivalent) Rain Pant. Two pass through
pockets with flaps, two cargo side pockets, side zippers for quick donning, adjustable ankle tabs.

$65.00

NO BID

$75.00

$141.50

$60.91

80

Lightweight, waterproof, windproof breathable (GORE-TEX® laminate fabric or equivalent) Patrol Style Jacket with
compressible, breathable PrimaLoft® insulation. Two chest pockets, two lower pockets, (all zippers water infiltration
resistant), full-length water-resistant front zipper, side zippers for weapons access, adjustable wrist tabs. Rochester PD
Shoulder patches on both sleeves. (To be centered on shoulder. Patches to be supplied by Rochester PD). Epaulets added on
both shoulders. Badge Tab on left breast. Side zippers for weapons access.

NO BID

NO BID

$145.00

$224.00

$284.27

Black leather winter jacket. Currently have Outdoor Outfits mod. 1010 with double patches and blue on black with white
outline around blue slanted 13 hash marks. Full liner. VVendor to provide name of manufacturer of item bid.

$375.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$317.69

Full-length Rain Jacket, black reversible, waterproof, windproof, high visibility yellow, ANSI certified class Il. Convertible
side pockets with waterproof zippers on both sides. Water repellent on both sides. Adjustable cuff closures, Sport collar zip to
top. Badge tabs and microphone tabs on both sides. Price should Include “Rochester Police” Screen on back in 3D lettering.
Current item # 5.11, 48125 Vendor to provide name of manufacturer of item bid.

NO BID

NO BID

$105.00

NO BID

$109.85 W/2 LINES NON REFLECTIVE BLACK; $107.85 W/REFL;EC

Dark Navy Spring/Fall reversible jacket, above waist, ANSI certified Class Il with high visibility yellow,
waterproof/windproof/ breathable fabric lining, badge tabs on both side, microphone tab on hi visibility side, double patched
with blue on black 1 % inch hash marks. Vendor to provide name of manufacturer of item bid.

$130.00

NO BID

$120.00

NO BID

$161.05

Black winter gloves. Currently have Damascus #D331

$31.00

NO BID

$27.00

NO BID

$26.77
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