
City of Rochester, NH
Bid # 15-49
June 25, 2015 3:15 PM

DESCRIPTION Fastenal Lawson
Bolts Course Thread
1/4” x 1” $0.0564 $0.0970

1/4” x 2” $0.1154 $0.1586

1/4” x 3” $0.1769 $0.2700

5/16” x 1” $0.1074 $0.1393

5/16” x 2” $0.1613 $0.2300

5/16” x 3” $0.2268 $0.3800

3/8” x 2” $2.1600 $0.3000

3/8” x 3” $0.3068 $0.4700

1/2” x 2” $0.3821 $0.5800

1/2” x 3” $0.5663 $0.8700

1/2” x 4” $0.7121 $1.3200

9/16” x 3” $0.7088 $1.1300

9/16” x 4” $0.9500 $1.5100

5/8” x 3” $0.8703 $1.3800

5/8” x 4” $1.1003 $1.9300

11/16” x 2” NO BID n

11/16” x 4” NO BID n

3/4” x 3” $1.2876 $1.9700

3/4” x 4” $1.7166 $2.7300
Bolts Fine Thread
1/4” x 1” $0.0641 $0.1198

1/4” x 2” $0.1356 $0.2200

5/16” x 1” $0.0977 $0.1664

5/16” x 2” $0.1926 $0.2800

3/8” x 2” $0.2400 $0.3800

3/8” x 3” $0.3407 $0.6100

7/16” x 2” $0.3459 $0.5100

7/16” x 3” $0.4900 $0.7800

1/2” x 2” $0.4244 $0.6700

1/2” x 3” $0.6278 $1.0000

9/16” x 2” $0.6550 NO BID

9/16” x 3” $0.8430 $1.4300

5/8” x 2” $0.6700 $1.1000



5/8” x 3” $0.9684 $1.6600

3/4” x 3” $1.4657 $2.3800

3/4” x 4” $1.6800 $2.6900

3/4” x 5” $1.9662 $3.2300

3/4” x 6” $2.5800 NO BID
Nuts Course Thread
1/4” $0.0245 $0.0734

5/16” $0.0362 $0.1069

3/8” $0.0431 $0.1556

1/2” $0.1035 $0.3300

9/16” $0.1959 $0.4900

5/8” $0.1920 $0.7000

3/4” $0.3117 $1.0400
Nuts Fine Thread
1/4” $0.0276 $0.0748

5/16” $0.0380 $0.1102

3/8” $0.0545 $0.1590

7/16” $0.0945 $0.2295

1/2” $0.1151 $0.3200

9/16” $0.1946 $0.4800

5/8” $0.2409 $0.6400

3/4” $0.4023 $1.0000
Flat Washers
1/4” $0.0219 $0.0553

5/16” $0.0231 $0.0772

3/8” $0.0308 $0.1078

7/16” $0.0400 $0.1600

1/2” $0.0786 $0.2200

9/16” $0.1010 $0.3000

5/8” $0.1410 $0.4200

3/4” $0.1635 $0.5900
Lock Washers
1/4” $0.0137 $0.0189

5/16” $0.0224 $0.0277

3/8” $0.0310 $0.0398

7/16” $0.0539 $0.0583

1/2” $0.0650 $0.0856

9/16” $0.0903 $0.1281



5/8” $0.1200 $0.2000

3/4” $0.2136 $0.2800
Stainless Steel Type 316

¼-20x1/2” $0.1121 $0.1508
¼-20x3/4” $0.1353 $0.1943
¼-20x1” $0.1578 $0.2207
¼-20x1 ½” $0.2322 $0.2900
¼-20x2” $0.2882 $0.3700
5/16-18x1/2” $0.2282 $0.2500
5/16-18x3/4” $0.2238 $0.3200
5/16-18-1 $0.2510 $0.3700
5/16-18x 1/12” $0.3461 $0.4800
5/16-18x2” $0.4517 $0.6200
3/8-16x2 ½” $0.7940 $1.1400
7/16-14x3/4” $0.4268 NO BID
7/16-14x1” $0.6407 $0.9000
7/16-14x 1 ½” $0.6930 $1.2400
7/16-14x2” $0.9531 $1.4500
7/16-14x 2 ½” $1.2671 $1.7100
½-13x1” $0.7712 $1.0400
½-13x 1/1/2” $0.9593 $1.2800
½-12x2” $1.1763 $1.5700
½-13x 2 ½ $1.4267 $1.9300
½-13x3” $1.7036 $2.3700
5/8-11x 2 ½” $2.0313 $3.1600
5/8-11x3 ½” $2.6748 $4.1700
5/8-11x6” $5.9460 $6.5900
¾-10x2 ½” $3.2135 $5.0000
¾-10x 3 ½” $4.1309 $6.5600
3/4-10x6” $7.0136 $10.3400
7/8-9x4” $6.9552 $11.4700
7/8-9x6 $10.5896 $16.2900
Stainless Steel 316 Flat 
Washers
¼-20x1/2” 0.0353 0.1087
¼-20x3/4” NO BID 0.1087
¼-20x1” NO BID 0.1087
¼-20x1 ½” NO BID 0.1087
¼-20x2” NO BID 0.1087
5/16-18x1/2” NO BID 0.1721
5/16-18x3/4” 0.0620 0.1721
5/16-18-1 NO BID 0.1721
5/16-18x 1/12” NO BID 0.1721



5/16-18x2” NO BID 0.1721
3/8-16x2 ½” 0.0677 0.2800
7/16-14x3/4” 0.1848 0.4400
7/16-14x1” NO BID 0.4400
7/16-14x 1 ½” NO BID 0.4400
7/16-14x2” NO BID 0.4400
7/16-14x 2 ½” NO BID 0.4400
½-13x1” 0.1782 0.6900
½-13x 1/1/2” NO BID 0.6900
½-12x2” NO BID 0.6900
½-13x 2 ½ NO BID 0.6900
½-13x3” NO BID 0.6900
5/8-11x 2 ½” 0.3405 1.0800
5/8-11x3 ½” NO BID 1.0800
5/8-11x6” NO BID 1.0800
¾-10x2 ½” 0.6771 2.1600
¾-10x 3 ½” NO BID 2.1600
3.4-10x6” NO BID 2.1600
7/8-9x4” 0.7073 2.9300
7/8-9x6 NO BID 2.9300
Stainless Steel 316  
Lock Washers
¼-20x1/2” 0.0377 0.0760
¼-20x3/4” NO BID 0.0760
¼-20x1” NO BID 0.0760
¼-20x1 ½” NO BID 0.0760
¼-20x2” NO BID 0.0760
5/16-18x1/2” 0.0617 0.1160
5/16-18x3/4” NO BID 0.1160
5/16-18-1 NO BID 0.1160
5/16-18x 1/12” NO BID 0.1160
5/16-18x2” NO BID 0.1160
3/8-16x2 ½” 0.1034 0.1900
7/16-14x3/4” 0.1323 0.3000
7/16-14x1” NO BID 0.3000
7/16-14x 1 ½” NO BID 0.3000
7/16-14x2” 0.3000
7/16-14x 2 ½” NO BID 0.3000
½-13x1” 0.2013 0.4600
½-13x 1/1/2” NO BID 0.4600
½-12x2” NO BID 0.4600
½-13x 2 ½ NO BID 0.4600
½-13x3” NO BID 0.4600
5/8-11x 2 ½” 0.3722 0.7400



5/8-11x3 ½” NO BID 0.7400
5/8-11x6” NO BID 0.7400
¾-10x2 ½” 0.6425 1.1500
¾-10x 3 ½” NO BID 1.1500
3.4-10x6” NO BID 1.1500
7/8-9x4” 0.9839 1.8100
7/8-9x6 NO BID 1.8100
Stainless Steel  316 Nuts

¼-20x1/2” 0.0791 0.1556
¼-20x3/4” NO BID 0.1556
¼-20x1” NO BID 0.1556
¼-20x1 ½” NO BID 0.1556
¼-20x2” NO BID 0.1556
5/16-18x1/2” 0.1230 0.2600
5/16-18x3/4” NO BID 0.2600
5/16-18-1 NO BID 0.2600
5/16-18x 1/12” NO BID 0.2600
5/16-18x2” NO BID 0.2600
3/8-16x2 ½” 0.1457 0.4100
7/16-14x3/4” 0.2834 0.6700
7/16-14x1” NO BID 0.6700
7/16-14x 1 ½” NO BID 0.6700
7/16-14x2” NO BID 0.6700
7/16-14x 2 ½” NO BID 0.6700
½-13x1” 0.3396 1.0800
½-13x 1/1/2” NO BID 1.0800
½-12x2” NO BID 1.0800
½-13x 2 ½ NO BID 1.0800
½-13x3” NO BID 1.0800
5/8-11x 2 ½” 0.6732 1.7600
5/8-11x3 ½” NO BID 1.7600
5/8-11x6” NO BID 1.7600
¾-10x2 ½” 1.1312 2.8500
¾-10x 3 ½” NO BID 2.8500
3.4-10x6” NO BID 2.8500
7/8-9x4” 1.6346 4.6300
7/8-9x6 NO BID 4.6300
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