
City of Rochester, NH
Automotive Equipment Belts & Hoses
Bid # 15-45
June 25, 2015 2:30 PM

HOSES-GATES # Jack Young Co. Napa PepBoys
18071 7.92 $8.49 $5.01
18079 7.11 $7.58 $4.49
18124 4.44 $4.60 $3.33
18126 13.62 $15.46 NO BID
19023 NO BID $11.25 $4.86
19025 7.32 $6.34 $3.21
19632 8.58 $8.55 $5.08
20206 10.82 $13.86 NO BID
20338 3.24 $3.69 $1.30
20431 12.77 $13.03 NO BID
20662 6.04 $6.52 $2.38
20731 19.56 $27.73 NO BID
21379 11.87 $10.85 $5.28
21580 8.70 $8.32 $4.58
21581 10.96 $12.22 $4.48
21620 12.94 $12.30 $5.35
21631 13.36 $11.58 $5.19
21774 7.03 $7.58 $2.84
21927 43.97 $28.04 $17.99
21931 NO BID $28.39 NO BID
21941 15.45/17.61 $15.47 $7.31
21985 19.03 $23.13 NO BID
22013 9.63 $9.64 $5.81
22032 22.46 $28.14 NO BID
22037 11.84 $10.13 $4.98
22038 5.20 $4.60 $2.36
22043 12.69 $12.78 $5.28
22082 14.48 $13.26 $6.08
22083 13.31 $10.92 $5.53
22105 36.48 $36.69 $13.83
22158 13.44 $14.39 $5.79
22209 12.32 $15.92 $4.93
22210 2.74 $4.25 $1.04
22216 36.35 $31.24 $12.24
22217 14.13 $15.39 $4.34
22242 8.92 $10.47 $6.63
22247 14.13 $11.58 $5.80



22356 9.68 $10.88 $3.98
22358 12.78 $14.61 $11.99
22379 NO BID $12.15 $5.45
22390 NO BID NO BID NO BID
22393 11.28 $12.30 $4.73
22437 12.93 $16.68 $5.39
22554 30.46 $29.06 $20.98
22651 12.20 $18.77 $5.50
22652 8.64 $7.83 $3.49
22696 11.94 $14.54 $5.34
22697 23.66 $28.41 $10.04
22698 12.62 $13.03 $6.43
22742 14.85 $12.58 NO BID
22907 7.27 $7.84 $3.83
22908 13.02 $14.06 $6.65
22960 11.70 $13.86 $6.29
22961 6.13 $6.85 $3.30
23021 9.54 $11.07 $4.88
23022 12.16 $19.41 $12.41
23087 NO BID $56.82 NO BID
23088 41.19 $50.86 NO BID
23099 51.04 $61.43 NO BID
23227 9.56 $14.06 $5.05
24216 24.56 $8.96 $20.21
24222 28.49 $10.16 $23.05
24228 33.35 $11.84 $26.46
24232 37.46 $12.77 $28.86
24236 41.97 $14.56 $32.35
24238 47.32 NO BID $35.86
24240 49.64 $17.28 $38.25
24242 53.68 $18.49 $40.31
24244 55.04 $19.11 $41.73
26417 7.40 $9.05 $3.69
26502 28.68 $12.59 NO BID
26516 33.80 $24.70 NO BID
26517 7.43 $33.33 $5.74
86621 NO BID $3.54 NO BID
86622 NO BID $4.12 NO BID
86623 NO BID $4.69 NO BID
86624 NO BID $7.78 NO BID
86625 NO BID $9.76 NO BID
86626 NO BID $5.91 NO BID



BELTS-GATES #
5514 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6728 6.34 $7.03 NO BID
6729 6.44 $7.18 NO BID
6734 6.91 $7.67 NO BID
6825 6.34 $7.03 $3.20
6829 6.78 $7.51 $3.41
6833 7.17 $7.93 $3.61
6836 7.59 $8.93 $3.81
6840 8.18 $9.07 $4.13
6841 8.36 $9.29 $4.20
6842 8.44 $9.39 $4.28
6846 9.06 $10.10 $4.55
6849 9.31 $10.36 NO BID
6851 9.51 $10.59 $4.80
6855 9.92 $11.05 NO BID
6932 9.12 $10.18 NO BID
6936 9.87 $10.98 NO BID
6937 10.03 $11.12 NO BID
7260 6.66 $8.03 $5.13
7340 7.16 $8.65 $7.36
7370 7.33 $8.84 $7.66
7430 7.97 $9.63 $6.19
7550 8.62 $11.27 $9.60
9447 10.71 $12.05 NO BID
9476 10.96 $13.25 $8.38
9480 10.80 $11.46 NO BID
9485 11.00 $9.63 $8.41
9341HD 9.48 $13.41 $7.36
9385HD 10.29 $14.91 $7.85
9435HD 10.60 $15.06 NO BID
9463HD 10.92 $13.96 $8.35
9490HD 11.02 $15.57 NO BID
9510HD 11.32 $15.27 $8.78
9520HD 11.72 $18.07 $9.10
9550 12.48 $13.85 $9.60
2/5VX500 NO BID $70.99 NO BID
3/5VX1320 NO BID $282.22 NO BID
3VX250 6.60 $7.20 NO BID
5VX1320 55.17 $60.18 NO BID
5VX500 20.82 $22.72 NO BID
9530HD 12.00 $17.38 $9.31



9540HD 12.16 $17.60 $9.36
9600HD 13.16 $17.58 $10.24
9610HD 13.27 $18.10 NO BID
9630HD 13.92 $18.10 $11.06
9650HD 14.79 $20.23 $11.39
9660HD 14.91 $20.66 $11.49
9670HD 15.16 $20.85 NO BID
9690HD 15.33 $21.24 $11.71
A34 4.78 $5.19 NO BID
A49 5.99 $6.56 NO BID
A57 6.53 $7.17 NO BID
A66 6.83 $7.96 NO BID
KO30441HD 12.80 $14.18 NO BID
KO40378HD 16.51 $20.83 NO BID
K050402HD 13.25 $15.31 NO BID
K050405HD 13.26 $14.26 NO BID
K060470HD 15.91 $16.97 $11.68
K060516HD 16.36 $17.38 $13.61
K060744HD 19.67 $21.04 NO BID
K060870HD 22.03 $23.80 $19.41
K060905HD 19.34 $19.85 $22.34
K060915HD 27.28 $28.70 NO BID
K060923HD 25.75 $27.17 $22.95
K060935HD 20.91 $22.66 $18.84
K060975HD 20.14 $21.52 NO BID
K061020HD 26.15 $28.88 $20.30
K091010HD NO BID $26.16 NO BID
K061177HD 25.39 $28.00 $19.00
L061187HD 30.61 $34.06 NO BID
KO61195HD 29.02 $26.69 NO BID
K070705HD 19.12 $23.16 NO BID
K070709HD 20.57 $24.60 NO BID
K070835HD 27.68 $28.62 $21.66
K070880HD 29.85 $29.50 NO BID
K071040HD 28.80 $31.55 NO BID
K080550HD 28.42 $31.87 $17.98
K080620HD 30.97 $36.49 $20.19
K080760HD 38.54 $42.72 NO BID
K080806HD 25.92 $23.36 $18.85
K080810HD 21.90 $23.30 $20.24
K080825HD 34.78 $29.51 NO BID
K081189HD 28.88 $31.99 $26.73



TR22474 12.25 $14.38 NO BID
86621 NO BID $3.54 NO BID
86622 NO BID $4.12 NO BID
86623 NO BID $4.69 NO BID
86224 NO BID $7.78 NO BID
86225 NO BID $9.76 NO BID
86226 NO BID $5.91 NO BID
BROWNING A-38 5.15 $5.67 NO BID
BROWNING A-39A

5.24 $5.73 NO BID
BROWNING A-40 5.32 $5.85 NO BID
BROWNING A-44 5.69 $6.27 NO BID
BROWNING 4L480

5.52 $5.67
BROWNING 4L370

4.58 $4.70 NO BID
BROWNING RBL A-
39 5.24 $5.73 NO BID
DAYCO AP37 5.06 $5.57 NO BID
DAYCO 4L390 4.80 $4.95 NO BID
DAYCO 4L340 4.39 $4.52 NO BID
DAYCO 4L360 4.53 $4.66 NO BID
DAYCO 4L400 4.91 $5.05 NO BID
DAYCO AP40 5.32 $5.85 NO BID
DAYCO L420 6.34 $5.19 NO BID
NAPA 4L410W 8.36 $9.29 NO BID
BANDO 
DURAFLEX 5L680 9.54 $10.83 NO BID
JASON UNIMATCH 
B67 (5L700)

10.52 $11.02 NO BID
BROWNING 
5VX2000 GRIP 
NOTCH 84.25 $84.94 NO BID
GATES 5VX560 22.68 $24.74 NO BID
GATES 5VX630 25.72 $28.02 NO BID
GATES 5VX710 29.12 $31.74 NO BID
GATES 5VX740 30.36 $31.45 NO BID
GATES 5VX750 30.38 $33.61 NO BID
GATES 5VX800 32.84 $35.87 NO BID
GATES 5VX900 36.71 $40.07 NO BID
GATES 5VX950 39.43 $43.03 NO BID



GATES 5VX830 
GRIP NOTCH 34.50 $35.37 NO BID
GATES 3VX530 
SUPER HC 10.16 $11.09 NO BID
GATES 3VX450 9.31 $10.15 NO BID
GATES 3VX500 9.82 $10.72 NO BID
GATES 3VX560 10.50 $11.45 NO BID
GATES 3VX600 10.99 $12.04 NO BID
GATES 3VX630 11.35 $12.39 NO BID
GATES 3VX750 13.20 $13.72 NO BID
GATES 3VX800 14.05 $15.36 NO BID
GATES 2X3V600 NO BID $37.53 NO BID
GATES 2X3V630 NO BID $31.18 NO BID
GATES XL9420 NO BID $11.45 NO BID
GATES HC5V1700 NO BID $76.17 NO BID
NAPA XL760, 
XL11683 NO BID $9.96 NO BID
NAPA 4L220W 6.34 $7.03 NO BID
NAPA B-75 11.57 $12.74 NO BID
NAPA A-65 7.14 $7.89 NO BID
GATES 6820 6.34 $7.03 NO BID
GATES 6721 6.04 $6.72 NO BID
FERRIS 1522062 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FERRIS 1522061 0R 
NAPA B173 NO BID $29.01 NO BID
NAPA B158 50 23.87 $26.54 NO BID
GATES A-50 6.04 $6.61 NO BID
GATES XL-9520 NO BID $15.07 NO BID
GATES AX60 8.92 $9.68 NO BID
GATES 6848 9.23 $10.24 NO BID
GATES 6841 18.36 $9.29 NO BID
GATES 6964 15.55 $17.29 NO BID
GATES 6836 7.59 $8.39 NO BID
NAPA 4L540W 9.82 $10.93 NO BID
NAPA 4L260W 6.44 $7.18 NO BID
NAPA 4L280W 6.66 $7.39 NO BID
NAPA 4L350W 7.42 $8.21 NO BID
NAPA 4L420W 8.44 $9.39 NO BID
NAPA 4L440W 8.80 $9.84 NO BID
NAPA 4L460W 9.06 $10.10 NO BID
NAPA 4L500W 9.40 $10.50 NO BID
NAPA 4L520W 9.62 $10.70 NO BID



NAPA 4L240W 6.34 $9.39 NO BID
NAPA 4L340W 7.32 $8.15 NO BID
NAPA 3L230W 6.04 $6.72 NO BID
NAPA XL11335 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NAPA XL 11555 NO BID $14.75 NO BID
NAPA XL08133 NO BID $8.62 NO BID
NAPA XL11433 NO BID $9.79 NO BID
NAPA 8X480 10.80 $9.08 NO BID
NAPA 4L660W 11.26 $12.51 NO BID
NAPA 4L200W 6.34 $7.03 NO BID
NAPA 4L330 4.28 $4.42 NO BID
NAPA #5L680W 16.38 $18.18 NO BID
NAPPA #4L700W 11.76 $13.05 NO BID
M110798 10.74 NO BID NO BID
NAPPA #4L250W 6.34 $7.03 NO BID
KABODA #5L960W

22.78 $25.29 NO BID
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