
City of Rochester, NH

Chemical Bid # 15-43

June 11, 2015 3:00 PM

Monson BHS UNIVAR Coyne Chemtrade Shannon JCI Carus 
Borden Borden & 
Remington Kemira Harcros Holland

Aluminum Sulfate-48% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.2550 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.9620 NO BID 0.8500

Sodium Hydroxide-25% NO BID NO BID 0.8476 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.7054 NO BID 0.7022 NO BID 0.7782 NO BID
Non Zinc 
Orthopolysphosphate NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.2921 NO BID 1.2300 NO BID 1.1700 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sodium Hypochlorite-15% NO BID NO BID 0.7766 NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.6500 NO BID 0.7141 NO BID 0.6945 NO BID
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc.
90% 220  Lb drum (Equivalent to NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sodium Fluoride 0.725 NO BID 1.9800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.7786 NO BID 0.7800 NO BID

Dense Soda Ash 0.1765 0.2042 0.1746 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1781 NO BID 0.1798 NO BID

Sodium Bicarbonate-Bulk Form 0.357 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sodium Bicarbonate-50 lb bag form
Equivalent to Natrium Grade #6 0.357 NO BID 0.6400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Potassium Permanganate NO BID NO BID 5.01 1.9868 NO BID 2.47 NO BID NO BID 4.0188 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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