City of Rochester, NH

Bulk Oil and Lubricants Bid # 14-51

June 19, 2014 2:45 PM

RECOMMENDED Dennis K. Burke Windward Finger Lakes Dennison

SHELL PRODUCT Chemicals
SHELL ROTELLA T 15W/40[$8.49 $7.64 No Bid $7.34
SHELL ROTELLAT 30 $509.00 $539.69 No Bid $475.00
SHELL ROTELLAT 10 $489.00 $574.75 No Bid $475.00
SHELL DONAX TG $7.49 $6.49 No Bid $6.25
SHELL DONAX TD $439.00 $372.35 No Bid $352.18
SHELL SHELLZONE $389.00 $256.67 No Bid $267.05
PEAK GLOBAL LIFETIME [$409.00 $308.69 No Bid $289.88
SHELL SPIRAX 80/90 $209.00 $168.40 No Bid $145.20
SHELL RETINAX LC $339.00 $244.00 No Bid $231.09
SHELL RETINAX LC $89.99 $21.28 No Bid $54.60
MS AW ISO 46 $5.79 $5.99 No Bid $5.15
SUNOCO TWO CYCLE No Bid $35.44 No Bid $31.38
UNIGARD 15W30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.63
OIL-DRI ABSORBENT $9.99 $6.78 No Bid $7.25
UNI-GUARD No Bid $15.43 12.23/ Ea./73.38 $31.38
OIL-DRI ABSORBENT $9.99 $6.78 No Bid $7.25




UNI-GUARD No Bid $15.43 12.23 ea./73.38 $31.38
CYCLO BRAKE & PARTS [$45.99 $24.41 $29.64 $22.05
CLEANER

CYCLO HEAVY DUTY __ [$46.99 $34.55 $50.52 $21.45
BREAKE AWAY

CYCLO STARTING FLUID |No Bid $26.15 $44.40 $23.55
WINSHIELD WASHER $129.00 $99.00 $491.95 $78.94
FLUID

SPIRZ GL 80W-140 $149.99 $61.60 No Bid $107.06
OMALA 680 80W-90 $64.99 $87.38 No Bid $87.05
MOBIL SHC 632 $219.00 $218.07 No Bid $165.68
SHELL OMALARL 460 [$229.99 $182.25 No Bid $182.89
MOBIL DTE OIL HEAVY  |$219.99 $75.40 No Bid $75.11
SYNTHETIC

SHELL OMALA 220 $219.99 $119.05 No Bid $81.76
MORLINA SD 220 $539.99 $891.00 No Bid $759.00
MOBIL 5W-30 SYNTHETIC |$31.99 $21.69 No Bid $34.50
MOTOR OIL

MOBIL DTE 26 #MO11128 |$48.99 $64.56 No Bid $48.50
SAE 30W NON-DETERENT |No Bid $19.95 No Bid $29.55
HYDRAULIC OIL No Bid $5.99 No Bid $5.15
URSA ED SAE 10W No Bid $28.71 No Bid $26.63
STARPLEX 2 GREASE No Bid $21.28 $47.40 $26.63
(RED)

CHEVRON SRI GREASE __ |No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
NLGI2 (GREEN)

SHELL ALVANIANO.1  |No Bid $118.71 No Bid $100.00

GREASE




PENETRATING OIL-PB __ |$46.99 $36.15 $50.52 $34.38
PENTRATING GREASE  |No Bid $38.34 $60.24 $26.63
(BIG RED)

CHAIN DRIVE No Bid $97.73 $55.56 $38.22
LUBRICANT

TEXACO CRATER 2X No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.81
ELECTRIC MOTOR No Bid $50.40 $137.16 $26.10
CONTACT CLEANER

DIESEL FUEL ANTI-GEL  [$69.99 $55.94 $75.00 $55.94
CONDITIONER

CASTROL SUPER CLEAN [No Bid $41.41 55.56/ 4.63 ea. $42.07
ICE-O-DRY WATER No Bid $38.64 40.08 cs/1.67 ea.  |$18.96
REMOVER

TELLUS T 15 (TROJAN) 52 [No Bid $79.87 No Bid $73.05
Y,

ANCOOL 3760 GLYCOL  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
(TROJAN)

STABIL CONCENTRATED [No Bid $66.38 60.72 c5/96.96 $65.28
FUEL STABILIZER

AERO-KROIL No Bid No Bid $50.52 $39.38
SHELL ALAVANIA EPO0_ [$104.99 $118.71 No Bid $112.75
SHELL ALAVANIAEPOO  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
SHELL CORENA PAO 1SO- [No Bid No Bid No Bid $136.00
32

FLUID PRO UNDERCOAT |No Bid No Bid $81.12 No bid
SPRAY

TEXACO MOLYTEC EP2  |No Bid $28.59 No Bid $2.08
CHEVRON SRI2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
NEVASTANE AW46 $99.99 $85.56 No Bid $109.00
MOBIL FM222 $69.99 $58.70 No Bid $5.81




NEVASTANE EP 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid $152.94
NAVASTANE AW32 $99.99 $86.19 No Bid $109.00
NAVASTANE AW46 $99.99 $85.56 No Bid $109.00
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