City of Rochester, NH
Chemicat Bid # 14-50

June 19, 2014

2:30 PM

Item Harcros Chemicals [Univar USA Kemira Coyne Jones Border and Remington |ChemTrade Holland | Shannon|BHS Monson |GAC
Aluminum Sulfate-48% No Bid No Bid 1.1680 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2419 0.9100 No Bid No Bid|No Bid 0.9790
Sodium Hydroxide-25% $0.8580 0.7586 No Bid No Bid 0.7831 0.7275 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|No Bid 1.1020
Non Zinc

Orthopolysphosphate No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2711 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.1900 No Bid|{No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hypochlorite-15% 0.6215 0.0624 No Bid No Bid 0.0591 0.0707 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc.

90% 220 Lb drum (Equivalent to No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|Na Bid No Bid
Sodium Fluoride 0.7589 0.7674 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.8461 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|No Bid No Bid
Dense Soda Ash 0.1795 0.1732 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1753 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1866]0.1805 No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate-Bulk Form No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|0.3520 No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate-50 Ib bag form

Equivalent to Natrium Grade #6 No Bid 0.4485 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid]0.3520 No Bid




